
ACT ( .  No. I OF 1931. 
,. . . . . : ,  . . .  F I - .  . 

[PAS.SED BY THE INDIAN LEGISLATURE.] 
,.. .. . . . . 

,.:: . . 

c e i v e d - t h e a s s e n t  of tha ~ o v e ~ n o r  General on the 1 9 t h  P !  

February, 1934:l I 

. . s ' < .,:; < , . +... : 

,:. . . . .  
. : : .  . , <  

t further to amend the 1ndi& Tariff Act, 1894, foi certain 
I , ,  . . . . ; purposes o . -. 

. : . j 

REAS it is expedient further to amend the Indian 
I : . j  . . .. , ,.. .or the purposes Lereinafte~ appearing; Ad;. ; 1894 . f .>b 

.. +., 1 
hereby enacted as follows : - . . . , 

1. ( I )  This Act may be called the Indian T i rY (Amendment) ~~~-~~~ 1 
. Act, 1934. ,/ .,:. . . . . . . . .. , : J , : ; :  % monk. I 

I 
(2) It, shag come into force on such date as'the Governor I 

,General' ii 'Council rnajFEy' notification in the Gazette. of' India, ..' 
i 

appoint in this behalf. 
"2. T4e amendments specified in the Schedule t o  th i i  A i t  Amendment Schedule 11 of 

made in the- Second Schedule . ~0 ,.the Indian Tafiff Act ,, f~g"~.vI11 ' of 
. : 

: "3. Notwithstanding anything contained in section 4 of 'the Bar of opera- 
tion of smtlon 

Indian Finance. Act,. ,1931, the additional duty imposed by t h a t  .:%(,,;tdfan A:k 
section of that h b t  shhll  not be levied or collected on any I931 and eee- 

tion k, Indian article chargeable w i t h , d ~ t y  under Item No. 45A of the Second Flnsnca (sup 
.vlrr 180n, Schedule to the ~i?cliaG'T&riff Act,  1894, as amended by section and Extend- i plcmentary I 

2 of this Act, and notwithstanding anything: contained in section ing) Act, 1931. 
4 of the Indian Finance (Supplementary and Extending) Act, . ' 

i 
1931, the additional duties imposed by that section of that I 

Act ahall not be levied or collected on any article chargeable i I 
with duty under Item No. 33, 35A, 41B, 41C, 42AA, 43D, I 
46A, 45C, d5D, 45E, or 141B of the Second Schedule to the I 

?[I[ ofl8Oh Indian Tariff Act, 1894, as amended by section 2 of this Act. 
THE . SCHEDULE 

I 
'Thia section came into effect on the 23rd December, 1.933, by virtuo 1 

of a .  declaration inser ted in the Bill under t h e  Pro$$io?al- Collection of 
>I Tnxee Act, 1931 (XVI of 1931). '. '.if- 

I - ' , 1 i 
Price anna I or l i d .  1 

i 
I 
I .  



Ind ian  Tarilf ( A m e n d m e n t ) .  

T H E  SCHEDULE. 

( S e e  section 2.)  I .  

Amendmen t s  t o  t h e  Second Schedule t o  t h e  Indian Tariff 
Act ,  1894. 

1. After the heading "OTHER FOOD AND DRINK", and 
before Item No. 34, the following item shall be inserted, 
namely : - 

" 33 , FISE OIL and whale oll, hardened or hydrogenated . I . 110 (I 0 

2. After Item No. 35 the following item shall be inserted, 
. 

I = I 
namely : - I 

"36A ) SUObR.OARDY . . . . . . . I  cd .  110 8 0 "  
, 

3. I n  Item No. 41B, in the entry in the fourth column, for 
the words and figures "20 per cent. or 4 annas" the words and 
figures "25 per cent. or 6 annas" shall be substituted. 

4. I n  Item No. 41C, in the entry in the fourth column, for 
the words and figures "20 per cent. or 2 annas" the words and 
figures "25 per cent. or 3 annas" shall be substituted. . 5. After the heading "CHEMICALS, DRUGS AND MEDI- 

' CINES", and before I tem No. 42B, the following item shall be 
inserted, namely : - 
" 42AA ' HEAVY CEEPIOALB, the following, 1 namely :- I 1 

(2) Magnesium sulphate or Ad valorem 25 cent. or one rupee and.. I hydrated ma~~nesium I four rannas p ~ r  cwt.,. 
sulphate. whichcver Is higher. 

( I )  Alum (ammonia alum, 
potashalum and soda 
alum). 

I 

6. After Item No. 43C. the following item shall be inserted, 
namely : - 
" 43D COTTON HOSIERY, the following, I namely :- I I 

Ad valorem 

(1) Undervests . . . Ad valorem 1 26 per cent. or one rupee 
and elght annas per dorcu, I whichever Is higher. 

26 per cent. or one rupee and, 
six annas per cwt.,~. whhh- 
ever Js hlgher. 

(2) Socks and stocklnga . Ad valorem 26 per cent. or ten annas per. 
dozen ,palre, whlchcver ls 

/ hlgher. 1 . i  
7. I n  I tem No. 45A, for the figures "35", in the proviso to 

the entry in the second column and in both places where 
they occur in the fourth column, the figures "50" shall be sub- 
etituted. 

8. After 
2 



OF 1934.1 Indian Tar* (Ameddment). 
h 

8. After the heading "MIGCELLA%O'IJS" and before Ikrn 
No; 46, the. fallowing items shall be inserted, namely: - 

-'45c GLASS asps8 -MD omxmys  / for lams and l~ntcrns- : 1 .  ' 
1 ( I )  Globes for hurricane Ad oalorm 26 per cent, or four ahnas and 

I lanterns. elx pies dozen, 
whichever 1s h?:ier. 

(2) Other'globea and chimney8 I Ad valorem 
Gvin an esternal base 
dlsmefer of over one 1 
Inch.= I 

' 
(el mhlte lead. acnulne. mobt i Ad Valorem i 25 Per Cent. or llve rumeeaand 

26 per cent. or three annas 
er dozen, whichever la 

~Iigher.  

, I ~ D  I P ~ T  eoloura and painter's 
ma&ls, the fouowlng, 
namelp :- 

(1) Red lead.reduced, dry . Ad cubem y cent. or four rnpeee 
a n  twelve annaa perowt., I whlchcver la hlgbcr. 

.-, - -  
or moist. ' 

' - 1  I and four .annus per ciwt., / whichever 18 hlnher. 

.-, . . - - 
and redti&d, &Y 21 
moist. 

(3) zinc white, genulne, 
moist 

(4) Tino Ghite. reduced, dry 

45E SOD household and laundry- 
- 

(i) ln JnSn bare of not lees 4 0 0 
&an one pound in / a, 
weight. 

(2) other sorts . . . 6 8 0 "  

I twelve annaa pi cwt., I whichever is higher.- 
Ad valorem I 26 per cent or a l ~  ru ceu per 1 c d . ,  whic'hever ' i s  hgher. 
Ad oal0rem 1 26 Per cent. or four mueea 

, I 

g. In  Item No. 88, the words and brackets "alum (namely, 
p t a s h  alum, soda alum and ammonia alum)" shall be omitted. 

10. In Item No. 93, the words "reduced dry red lead and 
white lead, moist white lead, reduced dry zinc white and moist 
zinc white" shall be omitted. 

I 1. In Item No. 94, after the words "GLASS AND GLASS WAR^" 
the words "not otherwise speczed, and" shall be inserted, and 
the words, figures -and brackets "all sorts except glass bangles' 
and beads and false pearls (see No. 131)" shall be omitted. 

12. In Item No. 100, after the word "Hosiery" the words 
"not otherwise specified" shall be,inserted. 

13. In  Item No. 116, to the word "SOAP" the words "not 
otherwise specified" shall be added. 

14. For Item No. 141B the following item shall be substitut- 
ed, namely:- 

HxAm GasarIaus, the following, 

I &gncsinm chlorlde . . . One rupeo and 0 ~ 0  armas per cwt. o r  I 26 per cent. ad valorem, whiohever 1s 
higher." 

15. Ia Item No. 157, the words "and sugar-candy" shall be 
omitted. 

16, In Item No. 158,- 
(a) the words and brackets "(other than fents of not more 

than nine yards in length)" shall be omitted; 
( 1 ) )  in sub-head (a), after the word "pieces" the words 

and brackets "(other than fents of not more than 
1 nine yards in length)" shall be inserted; and 

(c) in 
3 



- 

Indian Tariff (Amendment), [AOT I 

----- 
(c) in s u ~ : h ~ d - - @ ~ & e ~ t h e  word "others" the words 

"including cotton fents not othefwig -specifiedL- -- - -- - 
shall *be inserted. 

17.1n Item No. 175, after the words "whale dl" the words 
"not otherwise specified" shall be added. 

1s. After Item No. 184, the lollowing item shall be inserted, 
namely : - 
a$ l84A / EVUELLED IRONWARE, the 

ir;~owhg, namely :- I i 
. . .  (1) 31811-boards 30per cent. or four and a half 

amas per square foot, 1 ?& 1 .** 
whlchever Is hlgher. ccnt. 

metres, 

(ii) having an. diameter 1 exceeding 19 Ce~ti-  
metres. I 

20 
per 

ccnt. 

20 
per 

cent.. 

I 
19. In Item No. 186, to sub-item (a)  after the words "and 

the fittings thereof" the words "but excluding electrical earthen- 
ware and porcelain otherwise specified" shall be added. . 

90. After Item No. 186, the following item shall be inserted, 
namely : - 

ELBoTBIoat FiAETHEXVARE AND 
p o a o z u ,  the follodng, 
namely :- I 
.(a; ~ n e u l a t o r s , S h a c k l e ,  

Sinclalr Cordeaux or 
plntypd not otherwtse 
speciaeh- . . .  (i) fitted 30 per cent. or efght.cn 20 -... 

annas per dozen, whichever per 
is hlgher. cent. 1 

. . .  ((i) not fitted 30 per cent. or fourteen 20 ... 
annas per dozen, whlohever per 
la higher. ccnt. 

. (b)  Two way cleats . 30 per cent. or tow anna8 PCT 20 ... 
pose of pairs, whichever la per 
higher. cent. 

(c) gpaoinglnsuhtora . SO per cent. or two snnas per 
gross, whichever 1s higher. r I 

cent. 

I . . .  ( d )  Oeiling roses- 
({) fitted 30 er cent. or ten annas per ( tozen, whichever Ispigher. 1 z r  1 "' 

cent. 
I 

(fi) not fitted . . 30 per cent. or elght annasper 
d e n  l e v e r  is higher. 1 cent. g r  I "' 

. . .  (c) Jobt-box cut-0~ts- 
(i) fitted 30 per cent. or eight annas per 

dozen, ahiehever Ishigher. 1 cent. r 1 "' 

(ii) not fitted . I 80 per cent. or six s n m i  per i 
dozen, whlchever is higher. 



Ilzdian Tariff (Amendment). 
---- - 

- 
21.  aft^ Iteill-NO. 189,-th< foE&Gk shall be ioserted, 

namely: - 
'' 189A P~INTB colours and painter's 

mat&.+ the iouodng, 1 1 namely:- I I 
J 
I (1) Red lead, genuine dry 30 per cent. or Rs. 4-12-0 I 
I 

genuine molst and per cwt., whichever is higher. 
reduced molst. 

I (2) whi t s  lend, 30 per cent. or Rs 5-12-0 
per cwt., whichever 18 htgher. 

(3) Zinc white, genuhe, 1 30 per cent. or RE. 6 per cwt.., 
I dry. whichever Is higher. 
1 (4) Paints other sorts, 1 
I colohed, m o l s b  I 

cent. 

I (i) In Packing of 1 lb. or / 30 per cent. or B.. -0 per 
over. cwt., whichever Is hlgher. 

(3 In PacMng of + lb 1 30 per cent. or B. 11-44 
and over but less' I per cwt., whichever b6igher. 
than 1 ib. 

cknt. 
(iv) h ~ a c k i n g  of lem than ! 30 per cent. or B. 24 per j lb. 1 cwt., whichever18 hiiher. 

1 cent. 

22. dfter Item No. 191, the following item shall be inserted, 
namely : - 

20 ... 
p a  1 

' ' i ~ l ~  Doms~rc E A ~ T ~ ~ N ~ A R E  
China and pmcelaln, t h i  1 , following, namely :- 

cent. 

20 
gy 
cent. 
20 
per 

cent. 

20 
per 'hot' 
wr 

. ,  
' 

... 

.,. 

... 

30 per cent. or two 
per down, ~ ~ ~ h ~ ~ $ ~ g  / hlgher. 

I cent. 

I (a) Tea cups and coBee cups- 
(*) having a capacity of 

i more than 74 ozs. 

($0 having 8 capacity of 
not more than 74 OZR. 

I ( b )  Saucers- 
( 0  for use with tea cups 

Or Coffee CUDS having 
8 capacity of more 

i than :t ozs. 

( cent. J 

23. After 
5: 

30 per cent. or ten ann.8 per 
dozen, whichever Is higher. 

30 per cent. or few 8nna8 per 
dozen, ~ h l c h e v e r f ~  higher. 

30 PW cent. or five per dozen, whichever is h i g h ~ .  

(c) Tea- ots- 
( i )  LVjng a Camclty of ' 30 Per cent. or three rupees per ' 20 I 

more than 20 02s. i down, whichever is higher. 
cent. (10 having a capacity of 80 per cent. or  tmnty.four 
20 more than 10 om and a m a s  per dozen, w&hever is per not more than 20 ozs, higher 

(iil) I"v~"P a capaolty of 
not more than 10 o n .  

(I) sugar,boml . . . 
(e) having a capacity of 

over 10 02s. 

(J) Plates over j t  Inche8 in 
dlameter- 

(') Over inci1.8 in 
diameter. 

Kdi) over 84 In diameter. 

20 
per 'gt* 
per ' 

cent. 

2o 
per- 
cent. 

... 

..._ 
:,- 

' SO per c&t. or twelvc a n u s  per 
dozen. whichever 18 higher. 

30 per cent. or twentpfour 
annas Per dozen, whichever 
Is higher. 

90 ~ e r  cent. or twelve annag per 
dozen, whichever Is l~lgher. 

30 per cent. or sixteen an.1. 
Per dozen, whichever is 
higher. 

30 per cent. or ten annas par 
dozen, whichever is hlgher. 

I_ 

';gt. 
per 'Ztt. 
per 

cent. 

20 
per 

cent. 

lo 
per 



Indian Tarifi (Amendment). [ACT I OF 1934.1 
- - 

--- - 
23. After Itern No. -197,-the-following item shall be in- - - serted, namely :- 

Lsan PENGILE . . 30 per cent. or one anna per / e n  w e e r  is h i .  I $ 1 "' '' 
cent. 

24. In Item No. 202, after the word "glass" the words 
", earthenware or porcelain" shall be inserted. 

25. After Item No. 209, the following item shall be inserbd, 
namely : - 
'* 209A I PARASOLS AXD sURsHADES and , 30 per cent. . . . 

fittlngs for umbrellas, para- . / solaand s~nthades.  

26.' After Item No. 210, the following item shall be inseked, 
namely : - 
* 21OA TILES of enrthenware and 30 per cent. or two annse per 

porcelain. square foot, whichever is 
higher. 

27.' In Item No. 212, the words "including parasols and sun- 
shades, and fittings therefor" shall be omitted and after the 
words and figures "30 per cent." in the third column the words 
"or eight annas each, whichever is higher" shall be added. 

28. I n  Item No. 225, for the figure "5" in the fourth 
column the figure "6" shall be substituted. 

29. After I tem No. 236, the following item shall be inserted, 
namely: - 
'' 256A CAST IBON PIPES. Ad &em 20 per cent. or Bs.25 perton, .. 

. , 1 1 whichever la higher. 
cent. 

30. In Item No. 238, the words "hosiery" and "pieoe-goods" 
shall be omitted. 

31. After Item No. 238, the following ite- shall be inserted, 
namely :- 

I 

" zsu WOOLLEU AOGIEBY and ~d 35 per ccnt. or ei hteen 25 j ... 
woollen Lmitted apparel, oakwen.' annae per lb., whfchever per 

I t h s t  Is t o  say, all hosiery Is higher. cent. 
I and knitted appsrel con- 
I talnlna not less than 15 
I per cent. of wool by 1 welght. 

egsB / WOOLLEX FADRICS not ~d 35 per cent. or eighteen 26 ; ... 
( othcrwlse apeellled', con- valore?n. anllns per Ib.. whlchever per 
I talnioa more than 90 per Is higher. I cent. I 
! cent of wool exeluding 

felt 'and iabrics made of 
( shoddy or waste wool. 

FdDRlCS, not otherwise Ad , $5 per cent. . 
speeitled contalnlng not , valorem. 
more t h i n  10 er cent. 
silk or 10 per cen t  artlllclal 
silk, but  containing more 
than 10 per cent. but not  
more than 00 per cent. 
wool. 

, 
25 ! ..." 

cent. j 

32. In I tem No. 242, in the fourth column, to the iords  and 
figures "35 per cent." the words and figures "or RE. 20 per 
owt., whichevar is higher" shall be added. 


