
i 

THE ,CANTONMENTS (AILIEWDfilENT) ACT, I 953 

(No. 2 OP 1954). 
An Act further to amecd the Csntonments Act, 1924. 

BE it  enacted by Parliament as follows:- 

1. Short title.--This Act may be calleg the Cantonments (Amendment) 
A&, 1953. . 

2. Amendment of section 2, Act I1 of 1924.-In se'ction 2 of the 
Cantonments Act, 1924 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act).- 

(a) after clause (i,$, the following clause shall be inserted, 
namely :- 

'(iia) "boundary wall" means a wall which abuts on'a streeb 
and which does not exceed eight feet in height;'; 
(b) in clause (iv), for the braokets and words "(other thap 8r 

boundary wall not exceeding eight feet in height and not abutting 

a st"eti " the brackets and words "(othtr than a boundary wall)," 
shall be su stituted. 

3. Omission of Section 2A, Act I1 of 1924.-Section 2A of the principal 
Kcb shall be omitted. 

4. Amendment of section 4, Act I1 of .1924.-In sub-section (1) of 
section 4 of the principal Act,- 

(a) after the words "The Central Government may" the words , 
"after consulting the State Government and the Board ooncerned!A ' . 
shall be inserted; and 

(b) for the words "a cantonment" wherever they occur, the words 
"the cantonment" shall be substituted. 

5. Amendment of Section 12, Act I1 /of 1924.-In the proviso to sub- 
section (1) of seotion 12 of the principal Act, for the  yords "Provided , \ 

- ,that" the following' shall be substituted, namely :- 

"Provided that where a member of the Military Lands and Can- 
tonments Service is not readily available for such appointment, a w l i -  
tary Officer i m y  be appointed a ~ ,  the Executive  office^ for a period not 
exceeding three months : 

Provided further that". 

6. Amendment of. section 26, A.ct I1 of 1924,-En sub-section (3) of 
section 26 of the principal A&,-- 

(a) tha W O I - ~ P  "or the inhabitants into classes,," shall be omitted; 
and 

(b) the words "or class, as the case may be" shall be omitted. 

3 



i 4 Cantonments (Amendment) [ACT 2 

7. Amenaent of section 28, Act I1 of 1924.-In sub-section (2) of 
section 28 of the principal Act., after clause (da), the following clause shall 
be inserted, namely:- 

" ( d d d )  is a member of any other local authority; or". 

I 8. Omission of section 30, Act I1 of 1924.-Section 30 of the principal 
Act shall bc omitted. 

I 

/ 9. llrr~endment of section 31, Act I1 of 1 9 2 4 . 1 n  section 31 of the 
prineipel Act,- 

(1 in clause (a), the wmde "or of the inhabitants of a cantonment 
into c asses, or both" shall be omitted; 

(ii) in clause (b), the words "or dass of persons'.' shall be omitged. 

10. ~mendment of section 34, Act I1 of 1924.-To clause (b) of 
I sub-section (1) of section 34 of the principal Act, the following Explanation 

 hall bs a-dded, namely:- 

"Explanation.-In computing the aforesaid period of three conse- 
uutive months, no ,account shall be taken of any period of absence 
with the leave of the Board." 

11. Amendment of section 43A, Act I1 of 1924.-In sub-section (1) of 
section 43A of the principal Act, for the words "bazar areas" the words 
"civil areas" shall be substituted. 

I 

12. Amendment of section 73, Act I1 of 1924.-In sub-section (3) of 
section 73 of the principal Act, for the words "as the Executive Oficer 
may direct." the words "as may be determined by rules made under 
section 260. " shall be substituted. 

13. Amendment of section 103, Act I1 of 19!&l.--For sub-section (2) of 
section 103 of the principal k t ,  trlre following sub-section shall be 

c substituted, namely :- 

"(2) If any person, when called upop under sub-section (1) to 
furnish infomiation, neglects to furnish it within the period specified ! in this behalf'by the ;Executive Officer or furnishes information which 

I is not true to the best of his knowledge or belief, he shall be 
I 

/ punishable "with fine which may extend to one hundred rupees and 
shall also be liable to be assessed a t  such amount on aocount of tax 

i 
as ffhe Board may deem proper, and ' t h e  assessment so 
made shall, subject to the provisions of this Qt, be find." I 

14. Amendment of section 113, Act I1 of 1924.-In dause (b) of 
sub-section (1) of section 113 of the principal Act, for the words "one 
hundred rupees" the words "two hundred rupees" shall be substituted. 

15. A~hendment of section 114, Act I1 of 1924.-In sub-section (1) of 
section 114 of the principd Act.- 

(a) for the words "fifty rupees" the words "one hundred rupees" 
shall be substituted ; 

( b )  in the pl.nviso, for the words "two hundred rupees-" the 
words "five hund~ed rupees" shall be substituted. 



OF 19541 Cantonments ( A m e n d m e n t )  5 ,  
16. Amendment of seotion 118, Aat I1 of 1924.-In sub-section (4) of . 

section 118 of the priiicipal Act,- 

((() after the vord "picketed" the words "or straying" shall be 
iuserted ; and 

( b )  the words "as if the ariimal' had been found straying" shall 
be omitted. 

17. Amendment of section 185, Act I1 of 1924.- I n  sub-section (1) of 
sechion 185 of the principal Act, for the words "six months" the words 
"twelve months" shall be substituted. 

18. Substitution of new section for section 200, Aot I1 of 1924.-Far 
section 200 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted, 
namely :- 

"200. Power t o  t~ans fe r  ~ I J  public auction, &.-The Board may 
kransfer by public auction, for any period not exceeding three years 
at  a time, the right to occupy or use any stall, shop, standing, shed 
or pen in  a public market, or public slaughter house, or the right to 
expose goods for sale in a public market or the right to weigh or 
measure goods sold therein, or the right to slaughter animals in any 
public slaughter house :, 

Provided that where the Board is of opinion that such transfer 
of the aforesaid rights by public auction is not ,considered desirable 
or expedient, it may, with the previous sanction of the General Officer 
Commanding-in-Chief of the Command,- 

(a) either levy such stsllsges, rents or fees as it thinks 
fit; or 

( b )  farm the stallages, rents and fees leviable under clause 
(a) for any period not exceeding one year at  a time." 

, 
19, Amendment of section 210, Act 11 of 1924.-To sub-section (2) of 

section 210 of the principal Act, the words "or that the premises in which 
$he.business is intended to be established or maintained are unsuitable 
for the purposeJ' shall be added. 

20. Amendment of section 236, Act I1 of 1924.-In sectioii 235 of the 
principal Act ,-- 

(a)  after the words "Officer Commanding the station", wherever 
$hey occur, bhe words "or the Board" shall be inse'rted; 

(t,)  aft.er the words "before him" the words "or the Eoard, as 
the may be" shall be inserted; 

(c) for the words "he may" the words "the Officer Commanding 
the station or, as the case may be, the Board may" shall be 
substituted. 



Cantonments (Amendment) [ACT 2 OF 1.9541 
I 
I 

i 21. ~ m e n d m e n t  of section 237, Act PP of J.924.-In section 237 of the 
principal Act,- ! 

1 (a) after the words "Officer Commending the station", wherever 
I they occur, the words "or the Board" shall be inserted; 

( b )  for the words "as he thinks necessary" the words "w he or it 
thinks necessary" shall be subsbituted ; 1 

I 

(c) for the words."he may" the words ''he or, as the case may 
1 

be, the Board may" shall be substituted. 

22. Amendment of section 259, Act II of 1924.-in section 259 cf the , 
principal Act,- I 

I 
jn) in sub-section ( I ) , -  I' 

( i )  for the words "arrears of any tax and any other money - 1  
recoverable by a Board under this Act,': thE, words "arrears of 
eny tax, rent on land and buildings and any other money 
recoverable by a Board or a Military Estates Oficer under 

I 
I 
I 

$his Act or the rules made thereunder" shall be substituted; 1 
3 

(ii) for the words "tax or money" the words "tax, rent or 9 

money" shall be substituted; 
$ 

I 
I 
i 

(iii) for the words "growing crops or grass", the words "or i 
growing crops" shall be substituted; 

(iv) in the proviso, after the words "tools of artisans" the 
I 

words ''orowing crops up to the value of five hundred 
rupees acd implements and cattle used for the purposes of agri- 
culture" shall be inserted; 

(b) in sub-section (2), after the words "by the Executive Officer" 
the words "or the Military Estates Officer" shell be inserted. 

23. Amendment of section 280, Act I1 of 1924.-In sub-section (2) of 
section 280 of the principal Act, after clause (k), the following clauses 
shall be inserted, namely:-- - 

" ( 1 )  the grant of leave to the members of-the Board; , 
I 

(m) the form of notices required to be sect l~nder this Act a ~ ~ d  

i 1 ane manuer of h e i r  service." 

24. Amendment of section 2868, Act I1 of 1924.-Seotion 28611 of the 
principal Act shall be re-numbered as sub-section (1) of thah section and 
after sub-section (I) as s,o re-numbered, the following sub-section shall be 
inserted, namely :- 

"(2) The Board may, by a resolution passed in this behalf, dele.- 
ga t e to  the P~esident, Vice-President, Executive Officer or liealh 
Officer, ~ub1ec.l .lo such coi~ditions, if any, as may be ;pec.ified jn the 
resolution, all or any of its functions under snb-section (3) of section 
82, s11ls-section (3) or clause (b)  of sub-section (5)  of sectiori 119, sec- 

' tioa 131, sub-section (2) of section 132, section 143, section 101, sec- 
tion 163, section 164, se,c,tioli 168, set-tion 169, section 189, scctivii 190, 
section 191, section 194, section 195, section 196 or sectlion 197." 

- - 


