63 of 1948,

« .- THE, FACTORIES (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1987

e . No. 20 oF 1987
o : y _ [23rd May, 1987]

An Act further to amend the I‘actorles Act 1048.
Be it enacted by Parliament in the Thirty-eighth Year of the

Republic of India as follows:-—

1. .,(1)- This Act may be called the Factories (Amendment) Act, 1987,

(2')'7 It shall come into force on such date! as the Central Government
may, by notification in the Official Gazette, appoint, and different dates!
may be appointed for. different provisions of this Act,

2. In section 2 of the Factories Act, 1948 (herelnafter referred to as

_the pr1nc1pa1 Act),—

(z) after clause (c) the follong clauses shall be inserted,.'.

: v namely —

‘,.(ca) “competent person”, in relation to any provislon of this
Act, means a person or an institution recognised as such by the
Chief Inspector for the purposes of carrying out tésts, examina-

tions and inspections required to be done in a factory under the

provisions of -this Act having regard to— . _

(i) the qualifications and experience of the person and
.. facilitieg availeble_ -at his disposa_l; or .

(i1} the qualifications and experietice '6t'the peréons
employed in such institution and, ;_:acilitiies available therein,

with regard to the conduct of such tests, examinations and
1nspect10n and more than one person or institution can T%e
recogmsed as a competent person in relatlon to a factory;

" (cb) “hazardous process” means.any process or activity in

relation to an industry specified in the First Schedule where,
unless special care is taken, raw materials used therein or the
intermediate or finished products, bye-products, wastes or
effluents thereof would—

(1) cause meterial impairment to the health of the per-
sons engaged in or connected therewith, or

The provisions of sections 2,3,4 (so far as it relates to new section 7A), 5,6,7,8,9,10,

" 11,12,13,14,15,16,17,18,19,20 (so far asit relates to mew sections 41A, 41B, 41C, 41D,

41E, 41G and 41H), 21,22,23,24,25,26,27,28,29,30,31,32,33,34,35, 36,37,38,39,40,41

"42,43,44,45 (sofar as it relates to ‘the Pirst Schedule) and 46 shall come into force
on 1-12-1987; and .

The provns.ons of sectrons 4 (so far as it relates to new Secuon 7B), 20 (so faras
1t rélates to new section 41F including the Schedule referred to therein) and 45 (so
“faf as it félates to Second Schedule) shall come into forqe cn 1,64988
vide Notification No, S.0, 961(E), dated 29- 10 1987,

© gs5

Short
title
ang
com-
mence-
ment,

Amend-
ment of
section 2,



256

Factories (Amendment) ~ [aer 20
4(i8) : vesult in the pollutien @f thie: geherdl environment:

Provided that the:State ‘Government may, by notification in

v-Rhiei@fficial Gazette, amend the First Schedule by way of

addition, omdssion or vanatmn of any industry spemﬁed in the
s4id Schedule, 5

(i) in clause “(n),— | ’
(a} the ex1sting Explanation shall be numbered as Explana—

“dlfferent relays” the words “dlfferent groups and relays” shall

’ "'*e substltuted

(b) after Explanation I as so numbered, the follewmg E:fcﬁ@la- '
nation shall be inserted; namely:—

“Explanation II.—For the purpose§ of this clause, the

- #mere fact that an Electronic Data Processing Unit or a Com-
puter Unit is installed in any premises or part thereof, shall
not be construed to make it a factory if no manufacturing

- processis: bemg 'carneri on in such premises-or part thereof;”;

(m) in clause (n),

(@) ‘in the opening paragraph, the portion beginning with the
words “ and where the said affairs”, and é?ndin'g' with the words
“occupier of the factory” shall be omitted;

(b) before the' proviso ‘the following proviso shiall be 1nserted

- namely —

v “Prov1ded ‘that—

‘ (7,) in the case of a firm or other assoma’clon of indi-
viduals, any one of the individual partners or members
“{hereof shall be deemed to be the occubier;

(i1} in the case of a company, any one of the direc-
tors shall be deemed to be the occupier;

(i1i) in- the case of a"factory owned or-¢ohtrolled by
the Central Government or any State Géverhment, or
any local authority, the person or persons appointed to
manage the affairs of the factory by the Central Govern-
ment, the State Government or the local authority, as
the ease may be, shall be deemed to be the occupier:”;

¢

©' () in the existing pronso:._. _

, 3y for the Werds “Provideq that”, the WOF(IS ‘“Prowded
further that” shall be substituted;

(i) in sub-clause (o) of clause - (1), after the word and
Afigure “section 7,” ,. the words, figures-and. letteis. “seetion 7A
section 7B,” qhall be 1nserted

(iv) clause (o) shall be -omitted;



¥

qelggn Ea.atoaries:z. (Amendmants 257

{’u) in clause @), for the Word “relay” the words ¢ "group” or
“relay ’» shal] be substituted. ’

3;« In sectlon 41 of the prmclpaL Act—-

_ (&) after-the words: “The' State: Government may»,”.,.,.the words
_ “on 1ts own or” shall be mserted

(b) after: the words:“in. writing”; the wqrds “and sulo]ect to
such conditions ag it' may deem- fit? shall: be inserteds ...

~{c) the following proviso shall be added, namely:—

“Provided that no order under this section shall‘B& made by
the State Government on-its own mot;on unless an opportumty
of ‘being heard is given to the occupier.”,

4 In Chapter II of the prlnmpal Act, after’ seotlon 7, the followmg
sectlons shall be’inserted, namely:—

- “TA7 (1) Every occupier-shall ensure; s¢- far as i3 reasonably
pract1cab1e,, the health, safety and welfare’ of all workers while they
- are.at work in the factory. :

(2) Wlthout pre]udlce to the generahty of the prov1smns o:fp sub-
sectlon (1), the matters to which such duty extends shall include—

(a) the prov1s1on and: mamtenance ogﬁ plant andusystems of
work in the factory that are safe and without rlsks to health;

(b) the arrangements i, the factory for: ensurmgnsafety and
abseng_e of -risks. to: henlth.in connection withidhe usephandling,
storage and transport of articles and substances;

Iy . : ce g T
(¢) the. provision. of such information, instruction;.training
and. supervision as are.necessary to ensure the health and safety
-of “all workers at. work; . :

~(d) the maintenance of all places of work in tT_ i to
a condition that is safe and without risks to healthi and the pro-
v151on, and. maintepance of such means.of access-to,: gnd egress
v'ifrom such plages.. as are. safe and Wlthout suoh risks,

17

(e) ‘the provision, maintenance oF monltormg Of such work-
“Ang- environment in the factory for the Workers that 1s . safe,
without risks' to - health and adequate as regards fac1ht1 es and
arrapgements. for - their. welfare at work.:
(3) hxcept in such cases as may . be prescmbed evepy gecupier
shall prepare, and, as often as may be appropriate, revise, a written

i shptement of his general: policy with respect to: the-healthi and safety

. of the, warkess -at work -and::the -organisation andcarrangements for

o fherdinge Joeing in- forcefor rcarrying cout-that spelicy;-and to biihg the

. stetempentiandsany - revision: thereof: to the notice: of atl the workers in
Jrsugh - maamers- agsmay=beprescribied: -

T
A%ﬁﬁ,&-
ment of: |
section 4z, .

Inser-

tion of new
sections
TA

and 7B,
General
duties of
the
ocoupier,



General
duties of
manufac-
turers, etc,,
as regards
articles =
‘and
substances
for use in
factories.

258 FPactories (Amendment) [ack 205
8. Every person who designs, manufactures, tmports or
supplies any article for use in any factory shall—' ‘

(a) ensure, so far as is reasonably pract1cab1e that the
article is so designed and constructed as to be safe and without
risks to the health of the workers when properly used;

(b) carry out or arrange for the carrying out of such tests
7. and examination as may be considered necessary: for the effective
implementation of the provisions of clause (a);

(c) take such steps as may be necessary to ensure that
... adequate information will be available—

@) in connectlon with the use of the artlcle

in any
factory;

(ii)’ “about the use for which it is desigried and lteé,ted;
and v ‘
(i1i) about any conditions necessary to ensure that the

. article, when put to such use, will be safe, and without risks
. to the health of the workers:

Provided that where an article is designed or manufactured

outside India, it shall be o‘bligatory on -the part of the importer to
. See—~ ' ' B

(a) that the article conforms to the same standards 1f such
:»article is manufactured in India, or -

(b) if ‘the standards adopted in the country outs1de for the
- manufacture of such article is above the standards adopted in
iIndia, that the article conforms to such standards.'

) Every person, Who undertakes to design of manufacture any
-article for use in' any factory, may carry out or arrange for the
sgarrying out of necessary research with a view to ‘the discovery and,
so far as is reasonably practicable, the elimination o minimisation

_of any risks to the health or safety of the workers to which the design
'i)r artlcle may give rise. :

(3) Nothing contained in sub-sections () and (2) shall be con-

strued ‘to require a person to répeat the testing, examination or

_research which has been carried out otherwise than by him or at

L “his 1nstance in so far ag it is reasonable for him fo rely on the results
o thereof for the purposes of the said sub-sections.

(4) Any duty imposed on any person by sub-sections (1) and (2)
shall extend only to things done in the course of busmess carried on
e by him and to ‘matters within his control,

(5) Where a person designs, manufactures, 1mports or’ supplles

an article on the basis of a written undertaking by the usér of such

.. azxticle to take the steps specified in such undertaking to enstire, so
. - far as.is reasonably practicable, that the article .will: be 'saf¢é and
without risks to the health of the workers when properly tised, the



¢ 1087 Faetories (Amendmenty BT

undertaking shall have the effect of- relieving the: persoi-designing,
;. manufacturing, importing or.supplying the article from the duty
. 1mposed by. clause (a) of sub—sectlon (1) to. such extent as 1s reason-
“able hav1ng regard to the terms of the undertakmg

iz .(6) For the purposes of this section, an article is not:to be re- .

. garded. as. properly used if it is- used without. regard to any in-
formation or advice relating to its use which has been. made: available

by the person who has des1gned manufactured 1mported or supphed
the article. [

)

_ . Explanation.—For the purposes of this sectlon “artlcle” shall in-
clude plant and machinery.’,

5 In sectlon 9 ‘of the prmmpal Act-—«

(z) ins clause (a) after the Words “other pubhc authorlty,”, the
Words “or with. an expert” shall be inserted;

(i) for clauses (b) and (c), the followmg cclauses shall be sub-
stltuted namely —

AR T

| ' 3
“(b) ‘make examlnatlon of the prennses, plant :machmery,
article or substance,

(ey” 1nqu1re into any accident or dangerous occurrence,

whether resulting in bodily injury, disability or 1not, and take

.~ on the spot or otherwise statements of .any. person which he-
may - consider necessary for such inquiry;.

, .-~ -(d), require the production of any, prescrlbed reglster or any
+ ot ar, Other document relatlng to the factory,

. (e) seize, or take copies of, any register, record ‘or--othet
*'doctiment or any portion therect, as he'may consider’ necessary in

respect of any offence under th1s Act, which ‘hé has reason to
; M__beheve has been commltted

I

o

(f) direct the occupier that any premlses or‘any part thereof

or anything lying therein, shall be left undisturbed (whethér
generally or in particular respects) for so long as is necessary
o for the purpose of any examination under clause (b),

(g) take measurements and photographs and ake such
recordings as he considers necessary for the purpose of any

- éxamination under clause (b), takmg w1th h1m any necessary
1nstrument or equipment; ‘ i

' -'~'(~h~) in case of any article or substance found In any premises,
being an article or substance which appears to him as hdving
caused or is likely to cause danger to the health or safety of

“the workers, direct it to be dismantled or subject it to any pro-
‘cess or test (but not so as to damage or destroy it unless the

‘same 1§, in the circumstances necessary, for carrying out the

purposes of this Act), and take possession of any such article

or substance or a part thereof, and detain it for so long as is
necessary for such exammatmn !

(%) exercise such other powers’as' may be prescnbed no

Amend-
ment of
section 9.



Amend-
ment of
section 13,

Amend-
ment of
section
16.

Amend-
ment of

section 18.

Amend-
‘ment of-
section 19,

Amends
ment of

© gection 23.

Amend.
ment of
section 25.

Amend.
ment of
Section 28.

Amend-
- ment of
section
- 29,

shallubesubstitugeds. Co o

260: Hostaries: (Amendme.n.t);

Aty l‘m aie seetians 1320f thevprincipal; Acty—

(a) in' sub- sectlon @y, for: -the ‘portion begmnmg Wrth the
" “Wokds “a thermoreter” and-endifig with the  words “as may be
~-specified.”, the- followmg shall* be: substltuted namely: —

ez 20,

Spropet- measurmg Ansteuments, - at- such- places »andi” in such
.-position.-as may  be- speeified; shall be- :pravidéd<: andi suchy re-
- - cords; as-may-be- preseribed, shall: be maintained:;

(b) for sub-section (3), the followmg sub-section shall.be substi~
tated, namely: —

“(3) If it appears to the *Chief' Inspector ‘t‘h‘at‘;‘_"exé,essively
high temperatures in any factory can be reduced by the adoption
of suitable measures, he may, without.prejudice {o the rules.made
under sub-section (2), serve on the occupier, an order in writing

- specifgping the, measurescwhich; in.his.opinion;.skould be; adopted,
and requiring them.te:be :carried out:hefore.a:specified: date”

Y. Tn section’16-of :the princ1pa1 Act, in: sub-sectlon @—

(@) for the words “three hundred and fifty eub1c feet” the ﬁgures
~and words “9.9 cubic metres” shall be substltuted

. . (b) for the words “five hundred cubic feet" the ﬁgures and words
“14.2 "cubic’ metres” shall be. substituted,;

::(e) ofepthes -words : “fourteen. feet”; the figures-

and rword “4.2
metres” shall be substifuted: e

I RS )8 section 18 of- therprlnmpal Act, in sub-section- @)y for the words.
“twenty feet of any washing place, urinal  or latrine”, ‘the words “six
ngtesof :any.- washing place,  uzinal,. latrine,. sr}tt/om,; open drain
earyying.-suilage. or.- eﬁiuent or-any- 'other.,w..somee.,.. of,-;,gggtamination”

-

9. In section 19 of the principal Act, in sub-sectlon (2) in’clause b),
fory-the werds;, “thg;ee feet”v th,e Words “mnetx, centmretnes” shall be
substitinted.

100 In section 23 of, thg pr1nc1pa], Act in, sub-section , (1), for the words

“shall work”, the words “shall be required or allowed to Work” shall be
substituted.)

_ 1]1 In sectlon 25 of, the pr1nc1pa,1 Act, er the, words. “e1ghtee1; inches”,
the words “forty-five centimetres” shall Jbe, substityted. .

12210 sgetion:28,0f the: pringipal: Act,: the following; Egzplanatwn shall
he mﬁerted a} the end, namely:—

C “Egcplanthn —For, the, purposes; of. thrs section, no lifting
. mgchrne .0, apphance sha.ll be. deemed {0 be. a, heist or lift unless it

_has a platform or cage, the d_lrectmn or. movement of .which is
' restrlcted by a, guide or guides.”.

18, I section ‘29" of the prmc1pa1 Act,—

(i) in sub-section (1), in clause (c) for the Words “twenty feet”
the-wordg+six’ meprés'?:shallvbe. substituted; -



9a3987] - Puctortes A(Anéndmeht) 261

- (1) in the Explandtion,for clatse (b), the iollb\ﬁfiﬁg éléué& shall
be substituted, namely:—

“(b) “lifting tackle” means any chain sling, rope sling, hook,
shackle, swivel, coupling, socket, ¢lamp, tray or similar appliance,
whether fixed or movable, used in connection with the raising or
IO‘Wering ‘of Petrsons, or 1oads by uSe of 11ft1ng machlnes

14. In section 80 of the primeéipal-Act, in stib:sectioh (1), for thé words

“In every room in a factory”, the words “In every factory” shall be
- stibstituted.

15. In section 31 of the principal Act, for sub-section (I), the follow-
Yag sub-section shall be substitited, namely: —

“(1) If in any factory, any plant or machinery or any part there-
of is: opferated at a pressure ébove atmospherlc pi‘é:‘s‘sui"e eﬂ’ectlve

such tptént or maehmery o par‘n is not exceeded ”

16. In section 32 of the principal Act, for clause (c) the followmg
clause shall be substituted, namely:—

~

*(c) when any persoen has to Work -at a height. from where he
s likely to fall,

practicable, by fencing or otherwise, to ensure the
person so working”. - !

A7 For Section 36 of the principal Act the foll@wmg section shall be
ﬁﬁ%ﬁtituted ‘hamely:— _

. x
|

“36. (1) No pérson shall ba requited 6 allowed to &dtér any

- ehamber, tank, vat, pit, pipe, flue or other cofifiied spaée ih dhy fac-
tory in wh1ch any gas, fume vapour or dust is fikely to be Present

' to such an extent as to 1nvolve risk to persons being overcome there-

by, utiless it iy provided Wwith a tdatthole of ‘AdsqHaté siZzé ot other

effective means of egress. :

(2) No person shall be required or allowed to enter any confined
space as is referred to in sub-section (1}, until all practicable measures
have been taken to remeve:any gas; fume, vapour or dust, which
may be present so as to bring its level Wlthm the perm1ss1b1e limits

and to prevent any-ingress of suth g#s, fumé, vapour or dust and
unless—

(@) a certificate in writing has been given by -a competent
person, based on a test carried out by ‘himself that: the space is
reasonably free from damgerous. gas; fume; vapour or dust; or

(b) such persen . is wearkng suitable - br’eafhihg apparatus.
and a belt securely attached to a rope the free end ‘of which is
held by a person outside the confined space.”.

. 18. In section 36A. -of. the principal Act, in ctiize €a);, aftér-the words

“or other confined .space”, the words “unless adequaté 'saféty “devices are
provlded” shall be inserted,

provision shall be made, so far as is reasonably
safety of the

Amend#
ment of
sectio 30.

Amend-
ment of
section 31.

Amend-
ment of
section 32,

Substitu- -
tion of
new
section
for sec-
tion 36.

Precau-
tions

. against

dangerous
fumes,

gasesicetl,

Amend-

~ ment of

section

36A.



10262 - Factories. (Amendmenti U HfAce=20

Substitu. iz 19s For section 38-0f the principal Act, the followmg section shall be
tion of_ substltuted namely — b o
new .
section A e
for sec- Lo
tion 38. » .

g8, (1) In every factory, all practlcable measures Shall be taken
Precautions
in case of to prevent outbreak of fire and its spread, both 1nterna11y and ex-
firey.- ternally, and to provide and maintain— 1

4

(a) ‘safe means of escape for all persons in the event. of a
fire, and - ! ) Lo

iyl

(b) the necessary equmment and facilities for extmgumh-
ing ﬁre

2) Eﬁective measures shall be taken to ensure that in every
factory all the workers are familiar with the means of escape in case
of fire and have heen adequately trained in the routine to he followed
in such cases.

! : (3) The State Government may make rules, in respect of any
| : factory or class or description of factories, requiring the measures to
“be adopted to give effect to the provisions of sub-sections (I) and

@. - ~

(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in clause (a) of sub-
section (1) or sub-section (2), if the Chief Inspector, having regard
- to the nature of the work carried on in any factory, the construction
of such factory, special risk to life or safety, or any ‘other circum-
o stances, is of the opinion that the measures provided in the factory,
o whether as prescribed or not, for the purposes of clause (@) of sub-
section (I) or sub-section (2), are inadequate, he may, by order in
writing, require that such additional measures-as he may consider
reasonable and necessary, be provrded in the factory before such ‘
. date as is specified in the order.”

Inser- co 20.In the prineipal Act, after Chapter IV, the following: Chapter shalll
tion of be inserted, namely: — '
new

Chapter

VA, |

“CHAPTER IVA

PHOVIS-IONS RELATING TO HAZARDOUS PROCESSES

Consti- 41A. (1) The State Government may. for purposes of advising it
tution to consider applications for grant of permission for the initial location
of Site of a factory involving s hazardous process or for the expansion of
Appraisal ) h fact ] . Sit . ST

o .- any such factory; appoint a Site Appraisal Committee consisting of—
mittees,

(@) the Chief Inspector of the State who shall be its Chair-
man;

(6) a representatlve of the Central Board for the Prevention
‘and :Control of Water Pollution appointed by the CentraI Govern-
.iment under seetion 3 of the Water (Preventmn and Con’crol of
Pollution) Act 1974; [ ' 6of 1974,

|




or 19871 @ Factories (Am-end'me"m) " ¥ " 263

_ and Control of Air Pollutlon 1eferred to in sectlon 3 of the Air
14 of 1981, (Prevention and Control of Pollution) Act; 1981;

(d) a representative of the State Board appointed under
section 4 of the Water (Prevention and Control of Pollution)
Gof 1974, Act, 1974;

(e) a representatwe of the State Board for the Prevention
: and Control of Air Pollution referred to in section 5 of the Air
14 of 1981, (Prevention and Control of Pollution) Act, 1981;

(f) a represéntative of the Department of Envxronment in
the State; :

(g) a representative of the Meteorologlcal Department of the
Government of India; i

(h) an expert in the field 6f occupational health; and

(i) a representative of the Town Planning Department of the
State Government, :

and not more than five other members who may be co-opted by the
State Governiment Who shall be-—

(i) a scmntlst having specialised knowledge of the hazardous
‘process which will be involved in the factory,

(i1) a representative of the local authority within = whose
- jurisdiction the factory is fe be established, and

(1) not miore than three:other persons as deemed fit by

the State Government.
\

(2) The Site Appraisal Committee shall examine an applica-

_ tion for the establishment of a factory involving hazardous process
and make its recommendation to the State Government within a
period of ninety days of the receipt of such application in the pres-

~ cribed form. ». ' Lk

(3) Where any process relates to a factory owned or controlled
by the Central Government or to a corporation or a company owned
or controlled by the Central Government, the State Government
shall co-opt in the Site Appraisal Committee a representative nomi- ’
nated by the Central Government as a member of that Committee.

(4) The Site Appraisal Committee shall have power to call for
any information’ from the person making an application for the
establishment or expansion of a factory involving a hazardous
process.

(5) Where the State Governinent has granted approval to an

application for the establishment or expansion of a factory involving

a hazardous process, it shall not be necessary for an applicant to

obtain ‘a further approval from the Central Board or the State Board

established undér the Watey (Preveéntion and Control of Pollution)

6 of 1974, - Aet,; 1974 and the Air (Prevention and Contiol of Pollution) Act,

14 of 1981, 1081.

68 Law—35



Compul-

sory
disclosyre
of informa.
tion by the
occupier,

5264

Factories (Amendment),  [act 20

41B. (1) The occupier of every factory involving a hazardous
process shall disclose in the manner prescribed all information re-
garding dangers, including health hazards and the measures to
pvercome such hazardg arising from the exposure fo or handling

~of the materials or substances in the manufaciure, transportation,

storage and other processes, to the workers employed in the factory,
the Chief Inspector, the local authority within whose jurisdiction the
factory is situate and the general public in the vicinity.

(2) The occupier shall, at the time of registering the factory,
involving a hazardous process, lay down a detailed policy, with
respect to the health and safety of the workers employed therein and
intimate such policy to the Chief Inspector and the local’ authority
and, thereafter, at such intervals as may be prescribed, inform the

Chief lnspector and the local authority of any change made in the
said policy.

(3) The information furnished under sub-section (1)""§h5ﬁ=
include accurate information as to the quantity, specifications and
other characteristics of wastes and the manner of their disposal.

(4) Every occupier shall, with the appréval of the Chief Inspec-
for, draw up an on-site emergency plan and delailed disaster control
medsureg - for his factory and make known to the workers employed

~ iherein and to the general public living #n the vicinity of the factory

the safety measures required to be taken in the event of an accident
taking place.

(5) Every, occupier of a factory shall,—
(a) if such factor& engaged in a hazardous process on the
commencement of the Factories (Amendment) Act, 1987, within
a period of thirty days of such commencement; and
(b) if such factory proposes to engage in a hazardous process
at any time after such commencement, within a period of thirty

days before the commencement of such process,

inform the Chief Inspector of the nature and details of the process in

such form and in such manner as may be prescribed.

(6) Where any occupier of a factory coutravenes the provisions
of sub-section (), the licence issued under section § to such factory
shall, notwithstanding any penalty to which the occupier or factory,

shall be subjected to under the provisions of tth Act, be liable for
cancellation, :

(7) The occupier of a factory involving a hazardoug process shall,
with the previous approval of the Chief Inspector, lay down measures
for the handling, usage, transportation and storage of hazardous
substances inside the factory premises and the disposal of such-
substances outside the factory premises and publicise them in the

manner prescribed among the workers and the general public hvmg :
in the vicinity. ‘ e

R



. i
5
|
‘i

41C, Every occupier of a factory mvolvmg any hazardous process
shall—

(o) maiatain accuraie and up-to-date health records or, as the
case may be, medical records, of the workers in the factory who
are exposed to any chemical, toxic or any other hermful sub-
stances which sve manufactured, stored, handled or transported
and such records shall e accessible to the workers subject to suC‘l
conditions ag may be prescnbed

(b} appoini persons who possess qualifications and experience
in handling hazardous substances and are competent to supervise
such handling within the factory and to provide at the working
place all the mnecessary facilities for protectmg the workers in‘
the manner prescribed:

i
7

Provided that where any question arises ag to the qualifica-
tions and experience of a person so appointed, the dec1s1on of the
Chief Inspector shall be final;

() provide for medical examination of every workerow

(a) before such worker is assigned to a job involving the
handling of or working with, a hazardous substance, and

(b) while continuing in sueh job, and after he has
ceased to work in such job, at intervals not exceeding twelve
months, in such manner ag may be prescribed.

41D. (I) The Central Government may, in the event of the occur~
rence of an exiraordinary situation involving a factory engaged ina
hazardous process, appoint an Inquiry Committee to inquire into the
standards of bealth and safety observed in the factory with a view
to finding cut the causes of any failure or neglect in the adoption of
any measures or standards prescribeq for the health and safety of the
workers employed in the factory or the general public affected or
likelv to be affected, due to such failure or neglect and for the pre-
vention and recurrence of such extraordinary situations in future in
such factory or elsewhere. o

{2) The Committee appointed under sub-section (I) shall consist
of g Chairman and two other members and the terms of reference
of the Committee and the tenure of office of its members shall he

such as may be determined by the Central Government according
to the requirernents of the situation,
. f -

(3) The vecommendations of the Committee shall be advisory in
nature,

418, (1) Where the Central Government is satisfied that ne stan-
dards of safety have been prescribed in respect of a hazardous pro-
cess or class of hazardous processes, or where the standards so pres-
cribed are inaderaate. it may direct the Director-General of Fartory
Advice Service and Labour Institutes or any institution specialised
in matters relating to standards of safety in hazardous processss, to
iay down emergency standards for enforcement of suitable standards

in respect of sueh hazardous nrocesse.,.,

oF 1987] ' Factories (Amendment) - 263 -

Specific
responsi-
bility of
the occu~
pier in re-
lation to
hazardous
processes,

Power of
Central
Gavern-

“ment to

appoint
Inquiry
Com-
mittee,

Emer-
geney
standards,




Permissi-

ble hm1ts )

of
exposure
of chemi-
cal and
toxic sub-~
stances.

Workers’
partici-
pation .
in safety

manage- .

ment,

- Rightof -

workers
to warh

ahout
imminent-
. danger,

Amend-
ment off
sectiom

64,

- 266~

Factories - (Amendment) - [aer 20

(2) The emergency standards laid down under sub-section (I)

" shall, until they are incorporated in the rules made under this Act,

be enforceable and have the same effect as if they had been incor-
porated in the rules made under this Act.

41F, (1) The maximum permissible threshold limits of exposure
of chemical and toxic substances in manufacturing processes (whether

hazardous or otherwise) in any factory shall be of the value indicated
in the Second Schedule. ¢

(2) The Central Government may, at any time, for the purpose
of giving effect to any scientific procof obtained from specialised
institutions or experts in the field, by notification in the Official
Gazette, make suitable changes in the said Schedule.

41G. (1) The occupier shall, in every factory where a hazardous

process takes place, or where hazardous substances are used or

handled, set up a Safety Committee consisting of equal number of
representatives of workers and management to promote cooperation
between the workers and the management in maintaining proper

safety .and health at work and to review periadically the measures
taken in that behalf:

Provided that the State Government may, by order in writing

and for reasons to be recorded, exempt the occupier of any factory
or class of factories from setting up such Committee.

(2) The composition of the Safety Committee, the tenure of

office of its members and their rights and duties shall be such as may
be. prescribed. »

41H. (1) Where the workers employed in any factory engaged in

.a& hazardous process have reasonable apprehension that there is a

iikelihood of imminent danger to their lives or health due to any
-accident, they may bring the same to the notice of the occubpier,
agent, manager.cr any other person who is incharge of the -factory
or the process concerned directly or through their representatives

in the Safety Committee and simultaneously bring the same to the
notice of the Inspecfor,

(2) It shall be the duty of such occupier, agent, manager or the
(_person incharge of the factory or process to take immedjate remedial
action if he is satisfied about the existence of such imminent danger

and send a report forthwith of the action taken to the nearest
Inspector. {

(3) If the occupier, agent, manager or the person incharge
referred to in sub-section (2) is not satisfied about the existence of
any imminent danger as apprehended by the workers, he shall,
nevertheless, refer the matter forthwith to the nearest Inspector

whose decision on the question of the existence of such imminent
danger shall be final.”,

21, In section 64 of the'principal Act, in the proviso to sub.section (1),

for the words “does not exceed rupees seven hundred and fifty per month”,

the words, brackets and figures “does not exceed the wage limit specified
in sub-section (6) of section 1 of the Payment of Wages Act, 1536, as

am.

ended from time to time” shall be subshtuted

4 of 1936.




ond987] Factories..(Amendment) / o 267

%% In section 70 of:the principal ‘Act,—

“(a) in sub-section (1), the proviso and the Explanation shall be
omitted;

(b) afier sub-section (1), the. follovsﬁ_ng sub-section shall be

inserted, namely:— ;

“(14) No female adolescent or a male adolescent who has
not attained the age of seventeen years but who has been grant-
; ed a certificate of fitness to work in a factory as an adulf, shall
be required or allowed to work in any factory except between
6 AM. and 7 P.M.:

Provided that the State Government may, by notification in

the Qfficial Gazette, in respect of any factory or group or class
or description of factories,—

7 (i), vary the limits laid down in this sub-section so, how-
ever, that no such section shall authorise the employment
of any female adolescent between 10 P.M. and 5 AM,;

(i) grant exemption from the provisions of this sub-
section in case of serious emergency where national interest

is involved.”, .

23. In section 71 of the principal Act, after sub-section (4), the follow-
Ing sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

“(5) No female child shall be required or allowed to work in
_any factory except between 8 AM. and 7 P.M.”.

24. In section 80 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), —

(@) for the words “shall be paid”, the words “shall be entltled to
wages” shall be substituted;

(b) the following provxso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided that in the case of a worker who has not worked
‘on any day during the calendar month immediately preceding
his leave, he shall be paid at a rate equal to the daily average
of his total full time earnings for the days on which he actually

worked during the last calendar month preceding his leave, in

which he actually worked, exclusive of any overtime and bonus
but inclusive of dearnsss allowance and the cash equivalent of
the advantage accruing through the concessional sale to the
workers of foodgraing and other articles.”.

25. In section 87 of the principal Act, clause (g) shall be oinitted,

26. After section 87 of the principal Act, the following section shall

be inserted, namely: — {

- “8TA. (1) Where it appears to the Inspector that conditions in a
factory or part thereof are such that they may cause serious hazard

. by way of injury or death to the persons employed therein or to
the general public in the vicinity, he may, by order in writing to
the occupier of the factory, state the particulars in respect of which
e considers the factory or part thereof to be the cause of such

Amend-

" ment of

section 70,

Amend-
ment of
section
1,

Amend-
ment of
section 80,

Amend-
ment of
section, 87,

Insertion;of
new section
87A, -

Power to
prohibit

employ-
ment on
account
of serious
hazard.



268 ' Factories (Amendment) | [ACT 20

serious hazard and prohibit such occupier from employing any
person in the factory or amy part thereof other than the minimum
number of persons necessary to attend to the minimum tasks till
the hazard is removed.

(2) Any order issued by the Inspector under sub-section (1) shall
‘have effect for a period of three days until extended by the Chief
Inspector by a subsequent order,

- {3) Any person aggrieved by an order of the Inspector under
sub-section (1), and the Chief Inspector under sub~se<.tmn (2), shall
have the right to appeal to the High Court.

(4) Any person whose employment has been affected by an order

, issued under sub-section (1), shall be entitled to wages and other
benefits and it shall be the duty of the occupier to provide alternative
employment to him wherever possible and in the manner prescribed.

(5) The provisions of sub-section (4) shall be w1thout prejudice
to the rights of the parties under the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947.”.

Amend- 27. In section 8% of the principal Act—.
ment of :
section (i) for the words “the Schedule”, wherever they occur, the

89, . - words “the Third Schedule” shall be substituted;

(1) in sub-section (4), for the words “fifty rupees”, the words
“one thousand rupees” shall be substituted;

(ti) after sub-section '(4); the following sub-section shail be
added, namely:—

“{5% The Central Government may, by notification in the
Official Gazette, add to or alfer the Third Schedule and any such

additlon or alteration ghall have nﬁect ag if it had been made

by this Act.”.

Amend- 28. In section 90 of the principal Act, in sub~section (1), for the words
ment of “the Schedule”, the words. “the Third Schedule” shall be substituted.
gection 90. .

Amend- 28, In section 81A of the prmmpal Act, after sub section (3}, the
met{’t of following Explanation shall be inserted, namely:—

section -

91A,

“Explonation.—For the purposes of this section, the report, if any,
submitted to the State Government by the persoh conducting the

survey under sub-section (1) shall be deemea to be a report suanfted R

‘ by an Inspector under thls Aet? 2
Amend- 20. Tn section 92 of the principal Act—
ment of

- section. 92, - (o} for the words “three months" the words “two years” shall
e be substituted; . »

{b) for the words “two thousand rupees”, the words “one lakh
tupees” ghall he substituted;

(¢} for the words “seventy-ﬁve rupees”, the words “f)np thousand -

rupees”’ ghall he woc’ntut@d

{d} for the words “one thousand rupees”, the words n"tvs,le:tlt.v-
five thousand rupees” shall be substitufed:

14 of 1947.



- oF 1987] . Factories (Amendment) © 269

(e) for the words “five hundred rupees”, the words “five
thousand rupees” shall be. substituted, !

~

31. In section 94 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),—

(i) for the words “six months”, the words “three years” shall be
substituted; : ‘

(it) for the words “two hundred rupees”, wherever they occur,

the words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted;

(iii) for the words “five thousand rupees”, the words “twg lakh

rupees” shall be substituted;

x

(iw) for the words “two thousand rupees”, the words “thirty-five
thousand rupees” shall be substituted;

{v) for the words ",‘one thousand rupees”, the words “ten
thousand rupees” shall be substituted,

32. In section 95 of the principa] Act, for the words “three months”
and “five hundred rupees”, the words “six months” and “fen thousand
rupees” shall, respectively, be substituted.

33. In section 96 of the principal Act, for the words “three months”
and “five hundred rupees”, the words “six months” angd “ten thousand
rupees” shall respectively, be substituted.

34. After section 96 of the principal Act, the following section shall
be inserted, namely:—

“96A., (1) Whoever fails to comply with or contravenes any of.

the provisions of section 41B, 41C or 41 or the rules made there-
under, shall, in respect of such failure or contravention, be punish-
able with imprisonment for a term which may extend to seven years

and with fine which may extend to two lakh rupees, and in case the’

failure or contravention continues, with additional fing which may

extend to five thousand rupees for every day during which such

failure or contravention continues after the conviction for the first
such failure or contravention, :

(2) It the failure' or contravention referred to in sub-section (1)
continues beyond a period of one year after the date of cenviction, the
offender shall be punishable with imprisonment for a term Wthh may

“extend to ten years.”. dad

35. In section 97 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the words .

“‘twenty rupees”, the ‘words “five hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

. 38, In section 98 of the pfincipal\Act, for the words “one month” and
“fifty rupees”, the words “two months” and “one thousand rupees” shall,
respec-tively, be substituted

37. In section 89 of the principal Act, for the words “fifty rupees” the
words  “one thousand rupees” shall he substltuted

-Amend-

ment.of
section 94,

Amend-

. ment of

section .

.95..

Amend-
ment of
section -
90,

Insertxon
of new
section
864,

‘Penalty
for coti
traven-
tion of
the pro-
visions
of sec-
tiong
41B, 41C
and 41H,

Amend-
ment of
septien 97.

Amend-
ment of
section 98.

Amend-
ment of
saction 99.



Omission
of section
100,

Ingertion

of! iew
sectiopy
104A,

Onus

of prov-
ing limits
of whatis
practicable,
etc.

Insertion
of new
" section

106A.
Jurisdiction
oftd-cotrt
for entér-
taining
proceed-
ings;etc.,
féi‘i'c‘)ffence ‘

Insemon
ot new
séétion
111A,
Right

of workers,
Stee.

Amend. >
ment of

S¢ction 115,

. 270 Factories _(Amenciment) - [acz 20

38, Section 100 of the principal Act shall be omitted.

35. After section 104 of the pmnmpal Act the following section shall
be inserted, namely:— )

| . P ot

“l04A. In any proceeding for an offence for the contravention
of any provision of this Act or rules made thereunder consisting of a
failure to comply with a duty or requirement to do something, it
shall be for the person who is alleged to have failed to comply
with such duty or requirement, to prove that it was not' reasonably
practicable or, as the case may be, all practicable measures were
taken to satisfy the duty or requirement.”,

40, In Chiapter X of the principal Act, after séction 106, the following
section shall be inserted, namiely:— : ’

“l06A. For the purposes of conferring jurisdiction on any court
in relation to an offence under this Act or the rules made thereunder
in connection with the operation of any plant, the place where the
plant is for the time being situate shall be deemed to be the place
where such offence has been commltted 7, o
41. After section 111 of the principal Act, tne following section shall

be inserted, namely: —
/

- “111A. Every worker shall have the right {o—

(i) obtain from the occupier, information relating to
workers’ health and safety at work, '

(i1) get trained within the factory wherever possible; or, to

get himself sponsored by the occupier for getting trained at a

training centre or institute, duly. approved by the Chief
Inspector, where training ig imhparted for Workers’ health and

safety at work, ' ' e

. (i#i) represent to the Inspector directly or through his
representative in the matter of inadequate provision for protec-
tion of his health or safety in the factory.”.

42. Section 115 of the principal Act shall be re-numbered as sub-
section (1) thereof and,— , , .

(a) in subnsectlon (1) as so re-numbered, for the words “three
months”, the words “forty-five days” shal] be substituted;

(b) after sub-section (1) as so re—numbered the followmg sub-
section shall be inserted, namely:.—

“(2) Every rule made by the State Govemment under this
“Act shall be laid, as soon as rnay he after it’ is made before the
State Leg:slature ” f - T




j
i
|
|
j:

or 1687 . Faetories (Ameéndmenty. - ' 271t

43. After section 118 of the pr1nc1pal Act the followmg sectlon shall_-‘

be inserted, namely:—

“118A. (1) Every Inspector shall treat as confidential the source

of any complaint brought to his notice on the breach of any prov1s.€m

of this Act.

(2) No inspector shall, while making an inspéc'_cion under this
Act, disclose to the occupier, manager or his representative that the
inspection is made in pursuance of the receipt of a complaint;

Provided that nothing in this sub-section shall apply to any case :
in which the person who has made the complaint has consented to

disclose his name.”

44, In section 119 of the principal Act, the words “or any other law -

for the time being in force” shall be inserted at the end.

45. Before the Schedule to the principal Act, the following Schedules
shall be inserted, namely:—

“THE FIRST SCHEDULE
[See section 2(eb) 1]
L1sT oF INDUSTRIES INVOLVING HAZARDOUS PROCESSES

1, Ferrous Metallurgical Industries

—Integrated Iron and Steel

—Ferro-alloys

—Special Steels
2. Non-ferrous Metallurgical Industries

—Primary Metallﬁrgica].lndustries, namely, zinc, lead, copper, manganesc and aluminjum
3. Foundries (ferrous and non-ferrous)

—Castings and forgings including cleaning or smoothening/roughening by sarid and shot
blasting

4. Coal (including coke) industries

~ Coal, Ligaite, Coke, etc. -

—Fuel Gases (including Coal Gas, Producer Gas, Water Gas)
5. Power Generating Indistries ‘

. Pulp and paper (including paper products) industries

;a'c\'

Fertiliser Industries
" —Nitrogencus
---Phogphatic

. —Mixed ;
68 Law—36 : v

o8

Insertion
of new
section
1184,

Restric.

tion on
dis.

" closure
,of infor.

mation,

Amend.

*'ment of

section
119,

Insertion
of new
Sche.
dules,



272, S Factories .(Amandmenty:- ' [aeT 20 -

8, Cement:Industries ,
—Portland Cement (including slag coment, puzzolona cement and- theit prodtcts-
9. Petroleum Industries ‘
—Qil Refining
" _Lubricating Oils and Greases
10, Petmchem!&al Industries
- 11,3 Drugs and Phanneiceutical Industries
—Narcotics, Drugs and Pharmaceuticals
13, Fermentation Industries (Distilleries and: Breweries)
13. Rubber (Synthetic) Industries
| . id. "Pglnts_ and Pigment Industries.
~ 15, Leather Tanning Industries
14. Blectro-plating Industries
19, Chemical Industries

—Coke Oven By-ptoducts and Coaltar Distillation products

+~Industrial Gases (nitrogen, oxygen, acetylene, argon, carbondioxide, hydrogen, sulphur
'dioxide; nittous oxide, halogenated hydrocarbon, oZone, etc.)

—JIndustrial Carbon

—Alkalies and Aclds
—Chromates and dichromates
—legad and its compounds

=Electrochemicals (metallic sodium, potassium: and magnesium, chlorates, perchlorates
and peroxides)

==Blectrothermal produces (artificial abrasive, calcium " carbide)
~Nitrogenous compounds (cyanides, cyanamides, and other nit‘rogénousi Compounds)
. —Phosphotous and its compounds
aHalogeqs and Halogenated compounds (Chlorine, Fluorine, Brominé and Toding)
—Explosives (includirig industrial explosives and detonators and fuses)
18. Insecticides, Fungicid‘es; Herbicides: and - other Pesticides Industties
19, Synthetic Resin and Plastics

20. Man-made Fibre (Cellulosic and non-cellulosic) Industry
21. -Manufacture and repair of electrical ‘accumulators
22. Glass and Ceramics '

23, Grinding or giazing of metals

24. Manufagture, handling and processing of as_bestos and its products‘_,.

25. thraction of oils and fats from vegetable and animal sources ‘

26, Manufacture, handling and use of benzene and substances containing benzene
27, Manufacturing processes and operations involving carbon disulphide

28, Dyes and Dyestuff including their intermediates '

29, Highly fammable liquids and gases.




U —

s

OF -'\1;987] . “Fadtories (Amendment) ‘ "?273

THE SECOND SCHEDULE
(Seg section 41F)

P&RMISSIBLE LEVELS OF CERTAIN CHEMICAL SUBSTANCES IN WORK
: ENVIRONMENT

Substance - . Timec-weiglted - . -Short-term
4 average concentration exposure limit
8 hrs) (15 min)*
ppm  mg/m® ppm . mgfm?
Acetaldehyde . . . . . 100 180 150 270
" Acetio Acid . . . . . 10 25 15 37
Accton® . . . . . . 750 1780 1000 237§
‘Acreleln . . .. . . 0.1 0.25 0.3 Q.8
Acrylonitrile—skin . . . . 2 &5 L
Aldiin—skin' . . . . . .. 0-25 .. 0-73
Alyl Chlorlde . . . . . i 3 ' y I 6
Ammoenla . . . . . 0.25 18 o35 27
Anillpe—skin . . . . . 2 10 5 20
Auisidine (o-,Pisoners)—skin . . 0-1 5 ' .
Arsenic & compounds (as As) . . b. . 0 2
Benzene . . . . . . 10 20 oas 75
CBepllum. . . . . . .. 0.002 |
Bornon Trifluoride . . . - 0-1 03 _
Bromine . . . . . . 0.1 0.7 0.3 2
Butane . . . . . . 800 1900 : .
2 Butanon (Methylethyls Ketone-MEK), 200 590 00 885
n-Butylacetate: . . . . 150 710 200 950
n-Butyl aleohol—skin . . . C50 C150
secftert. Butylacetate . . . 200 950 25 . 1190
Butyl Mercaptan . . .. . 0-5 1.5 v iy
Cadmium-dust and salts (as Cd) . - . . wos . 2.2
Calcium oxide, . A . v_. 2 ' P .
Carbaryl (sevin) . . . . e 5 . EETO 1)
Carbofuran (Furadan)] . = . . .. 0.1 '
Carbon disulphide—skin . . . 10 30 )
Carbon monoxide . . . . 50 40 400 440
bon to trachloride—skin . . . mS$ 30 20 125

Carbonyl Chloride (Phosgene) | . . 01 04

—



“UT74

P

Factories (Amendment) “RofaeT 20
ppm mg/m®  ppm  mg/m?
] Chlorobenzene (monbchloro-benzene) R 350
Chloridane —skin - S 05 . 2
Chlorine . 1 3 3 ?
Chibroform Co 10 50 50 225
bis-Chloromethyl ether 0-001 0- 005
Chromic acid and chromates (as Cr) V . 0-08
Ghromous Salts (as Cr) 0.05
" Copier fume . 02
Cotton dust, raw 02 06
@resol, all isomers——skin . *° . 5 22
_ Cyanides (as CN)—skin 5 )
Cyanogen » 10 20 . ‘ -
DDT (Dichlocodiphenyl Trichlogoetheng) . f . 3
) Demctoll~~—;\kin - . 0.01 Q-1 0..03 0.3
" Diazinon—skin . 01 a3
Dibutyl Phythalate] . . 5 .. 10
Dichloryos (DDVP)—skin 0.1 t 0 3
Dieidrin—skin . . . . 0-25 . 0.75
Dinitiobenzene (all isométjs)—vskin 0.15 1 0-5 ) 3
Dinitrotoluene—skin . . 1-5 5
Diophenyl R 02 1~!5 O{\G 4
Endosulfan (Thiodan}—skin . 01 ' 7 04
Endrin—skin . ' 0.1 03
Ethyl acetate . 400 1400 .
Ethylalcohol . .. 1000 000 ..
Ethylamin 14 18 .
Flourides (s F} . e . 25 .
Flourine . ’1 2 2 4
Formic Acid . . 5 9 .
Hydrazine—skin. . 01 01
Hydrogen Chloride . ;s 7 . .
Hydrogen Cyanide—skin . Cl0 C10 .
Hydrogen Flouride (as F) . 3 2.5 6 5
Hydrogen Perbxide 1 1 5 ) 2 o 3 ‘
* Hydrogen Sulphide 10 TRt
Gasoline . 300 %0 500 1500
fodine c w1 o o
Iron Oxide Fume (FegO,) (as Fe) 5 _’ 10
Isoamyl acetate . 0 s 125 655




o

£ @R «1987)

- -Fagtories (Amentdment) 7275
ppm mg/m? ppm  mg/m®
:;zﬁalsoamyl'salqdhof 100 300 o125 e 450
Isobutyl algohol 50 150 T8 7 2235
Lead, inorg, fumes and dusts (as Pb) . 0-15 .. 0.45
Lindane—skin . 05 1-5
Malathion—skin . o 10 e .
~ Manganese (as Mn)\;q_ust and compounds cos . o
Fume . 1 0.3
* " Morcury (as Hg) —skin Alkyl compounds o1 0.03
All forms except alkyl vapour 0.05 .
Aryl and inorganic compounds 0.1
£ Methyl alcohol (methonol)—skin . 200 60 250 310
Methyl cellosolve—skin (2 methoxy ethanol) - 5 16
Methyl isobutyl Ketone—-skin . - . 50 205 75 300
Methyl Esocyanato : 0.02 005 :
Nefphthalene’ ©. . 7 .o 00w 107 5 15 75
Nickel carbonyl (as Ni) . 0.0% Q.35
Nitric acid 2 5 4 10
Nitricoxide = = . v 25 30 - 35 45
Nitrobenzene—skin 1 5 2 10
Nitrqgen dioxide . . . 3 6 5 10
Oilmist,minerals . . . . 5 . 10
Oxono .« . . 01 0-2 3 06
Parathion—-skin 01 0-3
Phenol--skin . . 5 19 10 38
Phorate (Thimet)--skin 0-05 ' 0-2
Phosgone (Carbonyl Chloride) 01 0-4 .
Phospbine . 0-3 04 1 1
Phosphorus (yellow) . . ‘ . 01 03
Phosphorus pentachloride . ) 0-1 1 .
Ph;spboms trichloride . 0-2 5 05 3
Picricacid—skin. . . . ., . 01 we 03
Pyddine . . . . . . 5 15 10 30
Silane (silicon }étrahydride) . 5 7 . ' .
Sodium hydroxide . . . . (07 ;
Syrene, monomer (phanylethylene) 50 215 . 100 v 425
Sulphur dioxide 2 5 5

10




53276 . Fodtories: (Amendment) - faer 20

AT ppm mg/m®  ppm mg/m? -

. e

Sulphur héxafiuoride L 1000 - 6000 1250 1500

" Sulpkuricacid . . . . . . . . 1-
Toluene (Tuluol) Coe e e e o 375 150 560
o-Tululdine— skin . . . . . . 2 9

© Tributyl phosphate” . . . . . . 0-2 25 04 S
Trihloroethylene . . . . . . 00 270 200 1080
Uranium, natural(asU) AR . . . ‘ 0.2 - Q-5
Vinyl chloride . . . . . . . § 10
Welding fumes - . . . . . . e 5

. Xylene {0-,m-, P-isomers) . - . . . . 10 435 150 - 655
Zironium compounds (as Zr) . . . . -3 10

C denotes ceiling Hmit.

*Not more than 4 times.a day with at least G0 min. interval between gsnocessive

exposures.
Substance Permissible time-weighted average ..concentgation
‘ hours)
(i) Silica
(a) Crystalline
(b) Quartz
) 10600 -
(1) Interms.of dustcount L i o — — o — - - DICM
% Quartz-- 10
vlod 10 .
(2) In terms-of respirabledust — —-——————rcimm— — ———— — = MM
% respirable quartz+2
. 10 :
3) Interms of totaldust ~  ———- T e e mg/m?
® , . % quartz--3 .

“Gi) cristabalite . . - . . Half the limits given against quartz.

@i) Tridymite . . . . . ‘Half the limits given against quartz.
- (iv) Silica fused L. . Same limit as for guartz.
(v} (@) Tripoli :.~‘ . . . Same limit as in formula 'i‘n'*ifta’mﬁ;g'iVe?"i"agai'ust 1aactz,

(b) Amorphous. . . . 705 mppem.”,




or 18811 Factories (Amendment) Y

46. The existing .Schedule to the.principal .Act shall be re-numbered
as the Third Schedule and in the Third Schedule as so re-numbered,
after entry “22”, the following entries shall be inserted, namely: —

“23, Beriyllium poisoning,
24, Carbon monoxide, |
25. Coal miners’ pnoumoconiosis,
26. Phosgene poisoning,
27. Occu_pational cancer,
28. Isocyanates poisoning,

29. Toxic nephritis.”.

Amend-
ment of

the

exist-
ing
Schedule.



