
THE FACTORIES (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1984 

No. 20 OF 1987 
C23rd May, 1987.1 

An Act further to amend the Factories Act, 1948. 

BE it enacted by Parliament in the Thirty-eighth Year of the 
Republic of India as fo1lov~s:-- 

1. (1) This Act may be called 1.he Factories (Amendment) Act, 1987. 

(2) It  shall come into force on such date1 as the Central Government 
may, by notification in the Official Gazette, appoint, and different datesll 
may be appointed for different provisions of this Act. 

63 of 1948. 2. In section 2 of the Factories Act, 1948 (hereinafter referred to as 
the principal Act) ,- I 

(i) after clause (c),  the following clauses shall be inserted, 
namely: - I 

'dca) "competent person", in relation to any provision of this 
Act, means a person or an institution recognised as such by the 
Chief Inspector for the purposes of carrying odt tests, examina- 
tions and inspections required to be done in a factory under the 
provisions of this Act having regard to- 

(i) the qualifications and experience of the person anel 
facilities available at  his disposal; or 

(ii) the qualifications and experience of'the persons 
employed in such institution and facilities available therein, 

with regard to the conduct of such tests, examinations a d  
inspections, and more thab one person or institution c%.n be 
recognised as a competent person in relation to a factory; 

(cb) "haaardous process" means any process or activity in 
relation to an industry specified in  the First Schedule where, 
unless special care is taken, raw materials used therein or the 
intermediate or finished products, bye-products, wastes or 
effluents thereof would- 

(i) cause material impairment to the health of the per.. 
sons engaged in or connected therewith, or 

- - - - - - - - - -- 
'The provisions of sections 2,3,4 (so far as it relates to new section 7A), 5,6,7,8,9,10, 

11,12,13,14,15,16,17,18,19,20 (so far as it relates to new sections 41A, 41B, 41C, 41D, 
41E, 41G and 41H), 21,22,23,24,25,26,27,28,29,30,31,32,33,34,35,36,37,38,39,40,41 
42,43,44,45 (so far as it relates to the First Schedule) and 46 shall come into force 
on 1-12-1987; and 

Short 
title 
and 
corn- 
mence- 

Amend- 
ment ofi 
seetion 2. 

The provis:ons of sections 4 (so far as it relates to new Section 7B), 20 (so far as 

". ' 'it relates td new section 41F including the Schedule referred to therein) and 45 (so 
fd? as it relates to  Second Schedule) shall come into forqe cn 176-1988. 

Vide Notification No. S.O. 961(~),  dated 29-10-1987. 

25 5 



256 Factories (Amendment) [ACT 20 

(ii) reSkllt sin <the lpoBution .9f ith'e:gk%efal ehvironment:. 

Provided that -the -State Government may, by notification in 
!2hb,rOKcial Gazette, amend the First Schedule by way of 
addition, omission or variation of any industry specified in the 
sa?d Sohc'dule;'; 

(2) in elause (m) ,-- 

(aj the existing Explanation shall be numbered, as Expluna- 
gon I and in Explanation I as so numberea, fm 'the words 
Wifferent relays", the words "different groups and relays" shall 
'k subdtituted; 

(b) df4er Explanation I as so nuAbefed, the fdlioWiHg Expla- 
Ration shall be in~er~ted, namely:- 

"Explanation 11.-For the purposeS of this clause, the 
,mere fact that an Electronic Data Processing Unit or a Corn- 
puter Unit is installed in any premises or part thereof, shall 
not be construed to make it a factory if no manufacturing 

' process l!s,behlg carried on in such premises ar part thereof;"; 

.@i) \n 'clause (n) ,- 

(a) in the opening paragraph, the portion begiklhing with the 
words ", and where the said affairs", and ending d i th  the words 
"oceupier of the factory" shall be omitted; 

(b3 before the proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, 
8 pame1y:- 

(i) in the case of a firm or other assokiation of indi- 
viduals, any one of the individual partners or members 
tfiereof shall be deemed to be the occupier; 

I 

(iif in the case of a company, iny  one of the direc- 
tors shall be deemed to he the occupier; a 

(iii) in the ca'se of a factoiy owrred or  cohtrollcd by 
the Central Government or any State GoVeiihment, or 
any local authority, the person or persons appointed to  
manage the affairs of the factory by the Central Govern- 
ment, the State Government or the local authority, a9 
+he ease may be, shall be deemed 60 be the osc~rpi-er:"; 

fc) in the existing prbvfS0;~-- 

'(i) f& the Words. L'4Prov2ded that", the ~@1rcf8 '$Provided 
further that" shall be ~ubstitut~ed; 

I 

(ii) in sub-clause (a) .pf clause ( I ) ,  after the word and 
figure "section 7,", the wo-xds,, fipces .and h$ter;s; "section 7A, 
section 7B," shall be inserted; 

(iv) clause (0) shall be-omitted; 



' / 

4v) in clause ( T ) ,  for the word "relay",' the words ' "ggoup" or 
"relay" shall be substituted. 

' ;F SP seF,tipn ,4 of' the principai Act,-- 

( a - ) k  after.~tkielword$ "The State.Government may,", the words 
,"on its own or" shall be inserted; 
J I 

' (b) 1 at.ftes the words "in writing", the wqrds, "and subject to 
such conditisns as- it may deem fit?' skqlli be insertqd; 

(c) the, following proviso shall be added, namely: -- 
"Provided that no order under this section shall b& made by 

the.$tate Government on its own motion unless an opportunity 
of being heard is given do the occupier.". 

. , Q, Iq Chapter I1 of the principal Act, after section 7, the following 
sections shall be i n ~ r t e d ,  namel~: - 

'9&. ($) Every occupier shall ensure, scr far as is reasonably 
practicable,, the health, safety and welfare of all workers while thex 
grg,at work in the factory. 

> I I 

t t  - L C  I , \ L  

(2) Without prejudice to the generality of the provisions-&::sub- 
section ( I ) ,  the matters to which such duty extends, shall include-- 

/ 

(a) the provision ,and mpi~tenance 08  plant; and I system 03 
work in the factory that are safe and without risks to health; 

(b): the >arrangements in: the factory for2 ensur;ing2,safety and 
a b s e ~ ~ ,  of risks to heal$h in connection withl~trhe usejlhandling, 
storage and transport of articles and substances; 

i I ,  .. ? 

(c) the provision of such information, instruction, tqining 
and,supprvision as ars~necessqry to ew,use the health +ad safety 
of all wpkers at, w,ork; 

(d) the maintedance of all places pf work in the fac$ry in 
a condition that is safe and without risks t 6  heaIth' and the pro- 
vision, and mqintenance of such means of access-,to/( gnd egress 
fyom, such piapes as are safe and without such risk;: , 

~ ~ 

(e)- th'e provision, maintenance or monitoring of svch work. 
ing.~envirol~meht in the fktory for the workers 'that is.  safe, 
without risks to health and adequate as regards ficilities and 
q~rangwents  far their welfare at work. 

(3) Except in such cases .as may be prescribed,-.eagpy qpupier 
shall prepare, and, as often as may be appropriate, revise, a written 

' ,?,  

~4w94l?- 
rnent &- 
section 44. 

Inser- 
tion of na 
se&tions 
7A 
and 7B. 

General 
duties of 
the 

t - s ,@t,q~~g~k of (hi$ generall policy. w&th respectr to the-h&altfil and safety 
,Q$ '&her werk,ws : at . WL)& qnd the organisation 'and~~ar~an~g&m&ts for 

. . i thr&iw ~3a&~-in- farc&\;Ecrr [carrying out, ath'at pdlicy; and to~ls?&g the 
~&@q@ntr :mcl;any revision ,thereof tdzthe noti~e>~oPaU th&.w~.kers in 

$ ?  ' @wh -romexP a$;ms~y:,be*pnescsibed. 



23d' Pactories (Amendment) [ACC 205 

General 
duties of 
manuf ac- 
turers, etc., 
as regaids 
articlh 
and 
substances 
for use in 
factories. 

'723. (1) Zvery pe'rson who designs, mamfactures, imports or 
&fiplies an$ article for use in any factory shall- 

(a) ensure, so far as is reasonably practicable, that the 
article is so designed and constructed as to be safe and without 
risks to the health of the workers when properly used; 

(b )  carry out or arrange for the carrying out of such tests 
and examination as may be considered necessary for the effective 
implementation of the provisions of clause (a ) ;  

(c) take such steps as may be necessary to ensure that 
adeqyate information will be available- 

(?) in connection with the use of the article in any 
factory; 

(ii) about the use for which it is designed and tested; 
tlna I 

(iii) about any conditions necessary to ensure that the 

I >  , 
article, when put to such use, will be safe, and without risks 

I ' .  
to the health of the workers: 

Provided that where an article is designed or manufactured 
outside India, it shall be obligatory on the part of thel importer to 
see-- 

. 
(a) that the article conforms to the same standards if such 

I . r ,, article is manufactured in India, or 

(b) if the standards adopted in the country outside for the 
) I ,  ,manufacture of such article is above the standards adopted in 

:,India, that the article conforms to such standards. 

(2) Every person, who undertakes to design or manufacture any 
ar'ticle for use in any factory, may carry out or arrange for the 
6a 'qing out of necessary research with a view to the discovery and, 
so far as is reasonably practicable, the elimination or minimisation 
of any risks to the health or safety of the workers to which the design 
'gr article may give rise. 

c ,  

(3) Nothing contained in sub-sections ( I )  and (2) shall be con- 
stmied -to require a person to repeat the testing, examination or 
research which has been carried out otherwise than by him or at 
'his instapce in so far as it is reasonable for him to rely on the results 
thereof for the purposes of the said sub-sections. 

(4) Any duty imposed on any person by sub-sections (1) and (2) 
shall extend only to things done in the course of business carried on 
by him and to matters within his control. 

(5) Where a person designs, manufactures, imports or supplies 
an article on the basis of a written undertaking by the use? of such 
'aqticle to Bake the steps specified in such undertaking to emitre, so 
far as is xeasonably practicable, that the article will be safe and 
without risks to the health of the workers when properly'h~ed, the 



Factories (Amendment) 2&$ 

undertaking shall have the effect of. relieving the person-designing, 
manufacturing, irpport,ing (or supplying the article from the duty: 

< ,  imposed by clause Ja) of bb-section (1) to such extent as is ~eason- 
able having reiard to the t e ~ m s  of 'the, undeytaking. 

1 ,J (6) Fpr the purposes of this section, an article is not to be re- 
garded as properly used if it i s ,  used without ( regard to any in- 
formation or advice relating to its use whicp has been made available 
by the person who has designed, manufactured, imported or supplied 
the article. ! 

Explanation.-For the purposes of this section, "article" shall in- 
clyde plant and machinery.'. 

B. In section 9 of the principal Act,- 

(i). in clause (a), after the words "other public authority,", the 
.word$ "or ,with afi expert" shall be inserted; 

(ii) for clauses (b) and (c), the following clauses shaJl be gub- 
etituted, namely: - I 

I ' j 
5\ ' i " (b) make examination of the premises, plant, machinery, 

article or substance; 
< > I  

( c ) ,  inquire into any accident or dangerbus occurrence, 
whether resulting in bodily injury, disability or not,' and take 
on the spot or otherwise statements of any person which he'  
may consider necessary for such inquiry; 

(a), require the production of any prescribed regkter or any 
, ,c, other document relating to: the factory; I ,i , r ,  * 

I (e )  seize, or take copies of, any register, record or othet 
' ' document or any portion thereof, as Weirnay consider necessary in 

respect of any offence under this Act, which he: has reason to 
, ,-, believe, has been committed; I- 

, r a i r  (f) direct the occupier that any premis@& or3any part therebf; 
or znything lying therein, shall be left undisturbed (svheth'er 
generally or in particular respects) for so long as is neces ar 
for the purpose of any examination under clause (b) ;  

:I 3' 
I i <  

Arnend- 
ment of 

section 9. 

(g) take measurements and photographs and make such , 

recordings as he considers necessary for the purpose of any 
, ' 

dxamination under clause (b), taking with him any necessary 
instrument or equipment; ! 

(h) in case of any article or substance %ouna In any premfses, 
being an article or substance which appears to him as hgving 
caused or is likely to cause danger to the health or safety of 
the wtirkers, direct it to be dismantled or subject it to any pro- 
cess or test (but not so as to damage or destroy it unless the 
same is, in the circumstances necessary, for carrying out the 
purposes of this Act), and take possession of any such article 
or substance or a part thereof, and detain it for so long as is 
necessary for such examination; 

I 

(i) cxcrcise suoh other powera7+as may be prescribed.", 



Amend- 
ment of 
section 13. 

Amend- 
ment of 
section 
16. 

Aanend- 
ment of 
section 18. 

Amend- 
ment d 
section 19. 

Amend. 
ment of 
section 23. 

Amend. 
ment of 
section 25. 

Amend. 
ment of 
section 28. 

Amend- 
ment ot 
sect im 
29. 

a@. 8agtwi~3.s: (Amendmen;t), :k!~% a&, 
b, JLBG we,tei~&, 139af tba\;grbciwl: &ti-- 

**(a) in 'sub-section (23, for- the portion be@%inilig, wftti" the 
' '  W&d$ '"a thermo+eter" &d-,epding with the words &'as may be 

specified.", the, following shall. be substituted; namely: - 
>cpaoper- measuring inst~umente, at such places andis: in such 
position., as, may be- spedfiea, shall be. prs'vidbd: andl such re- 
oorde, as! map. be prescribed, shall be maintained."; 

I 

(b) for sub-section (3), the following sub-section sh@.bz #&ti- 
kited, namely: - I 

"(3) If it appears to the Chief Inspector that ex6essively 
high temperatures in any factory can be reduced by the adoption 
of suitable measures, he m a s  with~.ut.prdudicg? to  .tho r u l e  made 
under sub-section' (Z), serve on the occupier, an order in writing 
sw~ i f~ ing ,$hq  measure~which~ in his,opjqion, should be: adopted, 
and requiring thqmh, te. be oaraied out, before a< specifi'ed*! date.". 

: .'I;. -In sectio1i~~l6 of <-the principal  AT^, in sab-section (2);- 

(9) fos the words "three hundred and fifty cubic feet", the figures 
and words "9.9 cubic metres" shall be substituted; 

L .~ 
(k,? fay. the;w~crds,,"five hundred cubic feet", the, figgres and words 

. ''14;.3. ~c~b5.c' me,t.r,esjl shall . b.~: substituted,; 
(,e) ,>fofi:ltJler wosds Yourteen feet", the figuries. and word "4.2 

metres" shall be swbst~ituted. 

;;. ,:8 . A' . 
., sB.ea. on . . :l~of-.~tA~ip&cipal-Act;. ifi subkse&thn (:Z3ii.for the words 

"twenty feet of any wash$ng'pl.ace, urinal or latrine"; :the words "six 
49~.@p%~(~f :+QpP:, w%Ma& p j , ~ ~ e ,  . wi~a, . ;  lat~jng,~ .s.]3&t,oq~;, open drain 
~ i i9y i~~~:suJ lag@.?  or r. e.@aqn& i or  .<a%y-:? .other. :. sougae .:. 0s:. ~~9tan;linatiorn" 
R B ~ ~ ~ ~ C B P ~ B U . ~ B U ~ Y E : B ~ . ;  ;... - , . , >  . > a  

9. In section 19 of the principal Act, in sub-section (Z), in clause (b), 
fmFF%a w~%dg,,''t@ge~, fqet", the, w ~ r d g  ''n.ip,ety,l cep$iqAqtq$fi" shall be 
w?4~tb:%ted. 1 

10. In pg~ t i , ~n  23, of,,thg pylncig?] Act, iq sub-sectian, (1 1, for the words 
"shall work", the words "shall be required or allowed to work" shall be 
~*$tikgt.@d.1 

, , W:,,& section, 33 &,the. prinsipql.: Act, fir, the. words.:fei,ghkeq inches", 
the words "forty-five centimetres" shag: .be,.eub&ita$ed. ' 

"EFP./~~?~R$~Z.W:-FO~, ::thg,. pw.rp,Qses + of .' this s~.cl$an, . QO lifting 
1?1;8~&.jne,,~o~,,.ap~!i,ar?~e ;~.sh.all. be:.:$<e~e,d -to b.e,.a, hc,$$ ,or lift, unless it 

i ' . ~ R s  ai,p@tf.C?rm.',or cQg%, th4, direction or,  mmvepeqt o f  which is 
. .  . 

. . r&st$jc$ed:.by a: guidg, oy..,guide~.". 

13. In  section '29 of the principal Act,- 

(i) in sub-section ( l ) ,  in clause (c),  for the words "twenty feet", 
the.-wor&j%~x;rne$~s'!~~sh'a~l~be. sub~tituted; 



. 4s) .in tKe Ewaan&tiab,.'$dr i&adse (b'),, ~ ~ e ; - L % o ~ ~ ~ ~ l ~ g  ':&-#u$&: shall 
, 

be substituted, namely: - . .. 

'(b) "lifting tackle" means any chain sling, rope sling, hook, . . 

shackle, swivel, coupling, socket, damp, tray or similar appliance, , . 

whether fixed or movable, used in connection : . .  . with the. ', . . raising or 
. ? >  :, . . ff.flg $, o.r yo:$& by .dS.e bf l'fti'&g i~AcKthes.'. . .  . ,  

. . 
. 

14. In section 30 of the prin&@al;A~$ tin sf.ib.~sedion ql$, f6k-m&."wczrds Amend.;; 

"In every room in a factory", the words "In every factory" shall be merit of 

sdbst!StVite'd. 
sectio, 30. 

15. In section 31 of the principal Act, for sub-section (I), the follow- 
Brrg shb-section shall be substituted, namely:- 

"(d) If in any factory, any plant or machinery or any part there- 
0% is: opera$a a t  3 -pp&g.*e aljbve atmosph&?c p&$su%e, effective 

. . ~ ~ - q ~ g U m S .  :sh:atl : take.h .ga'$aye tliat .$3j?& %Ij'rk!ihg ?P-p,$,$dure of 
'$.u:b],i: $,mflt o k  irlla.ehinei.y oy pafi 'is 'a(jt ekce&ed.-" 

16. In section 32 of the p,rincipal Act, for clause (c), the following 
&hse shall be substituted, namely: - 

\ 

" ( c )  when any person has to work .at a height from where he 
fs likely to fall, provision shall be made, so far as is reasonably 
practicable, by fencing or otherwise, to ensure the safety of the 
,person so working.". I 

. , '*~. at. poi. Section 36 of the princi-pal Act, the following section shall be 
i&j$&oft~be$, iiameiy: - I 

I . . . .. 

: 
, . 

,. 

. .N@ pB'rSBn 'b& i.eqd;yed gr &'J&j-i;isa + A  ..Fd&. any 
$,A&, :- it, pipe, <flue br ,o$xef Giifififi.&d $+&je -ifi ahy fat- , P 

tory in which any gas, fume, *&pubf or dG,& t i 'n~~l j r .  %'& '#resent 
' to such an extent as to involve risk to persons being overcome there- 
bfr,.r,ufiless:-it .ih. ;;rmidea w-rth & oif :&dgG~&f& $$& f,f other 
edfective ineans of egress. 

Amend- 
ment of 
section 31. 

Amend- 
ment of 
section 32. 

(2) No person shall be required or allowed to enter any confined 
space as is referred to in sub-section ( I ) ,  until all practicable measures 
have been taken to remove.amy gas, fume, vapour or dust, which 
may be present so as to bring its level within the permissible limits 
and to prevent any1 ingress d ssueh g$S, fumk, vapbur or d'ust and 
unless- 

(a) a ace-rtificate in writing has been given by a cbrm'petent 
person, based on a test carried out by himself +ha+ the space is 
reasonably free from dangerous gas, fume, vapobr <trr dust; or 

Substitu- 
tion of 
new 
section 
for sec- 
tion 36. 

Precau- 
tions 
against 
dangerous 
fumes, 
gases; -et%. 

Cb) such person is wearing suitable b~@ath+ng apparatus 
and a belt securely attached to a rope the b e e  end -af which is 
held by a person outside the confined space.". 

. . 
18, b section .:36Ad. Dhc .ppheipztI jAat, .h .d&&e -'4a):; att&~: %he words . .  . 

"'br other confined .space", the wordords. "unbss >Sdqua+& sa f@~c&vices  are 
providkd" shall. be inserted, 

Amen'd- 
ment of 
section 
36A. 



Substitu. r;H:~$'6r section 38- of the principal Act, the following section shall be 
tion o t  substituted, namely: - 1 \ 

new 
; ! i I t  section 

for se5- I 

tion 38. I , 

Precaugons "38. (1) In every factory, all practicable measures shall be taken 
in case of to prevent outbreak of fire and its spread, both internally and ex- 
fired ternally, and to provide and maintain- \ 

(a) safe means of escape for all persons in the event of a 
I fire, and i / 

(b) the necessary equipment and facilities for extinguish- 
ing fire. 

(2) Effective measures shall be taken to ensure that in every 
factory all the workers are: familiar with the means 'of escape in case 
of fire and have been adequately trained in the routine to be followed 
in such cases. 

(3) The State Government may make rules, in respect of any 
factory or class or description of factories, requiring the measures to 
'be adopted to give effect to the provisions of sub-sections (I) and 
(2). 

(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in clause (a) sf sub- 
section (I) or sub-section (21, if the Chief Inspector, having regard 
to the nature of the work carried on in any factory, the construction 
of such factory, special risk to life or safety, or Gy other circum- 
stances, is of the opinion that the measures provided in the factory, 
whether as prescribed or not, for the purposes of clause (a) of sub- 
section (I) or sub-section (2), are inadequate, he may, by order in 
writing, require that such additional measures as he may consider 
reasonable and necessary, be provided in the fattory before such 
date as is specified i~ the order.". 

Inser- 21). In the principal Act, after Chapter IV, the following Chapter shall 
tion of be inserted, namely: -- 
dew 
Chaptee ' ,  
IVA. 4 

"CHAPTER IVA 

PROVISIONS RELATING TO HAZARDOUS PROCESSE,, 

c ~ n ~ t i -  41A. '(I) The State GoveYnment may. for purposes of advising it 
tution to consider applicati'ons for grant of permission for the initial location 
of Site of a factory involving a hazardous process or for the expansioll of 
Appraisal 
Corn- any such factory, appoint a Site Appraisal Com,mittee consisting of- 

mittees. (a) the; Chief Inspector of the State who shall be its Chair- 
man ; 

(8) a representative of the Central Board for the Prevention 
and Control of Water Pollution appointed by the CentraI Govern- 

, .  ment under section 3 of the Water (Preventizn and Control of 

* .  
Pollution) Act, 1974; 1 



I 
I 

OE 19871 Factories (Amend~meht) 263 
I 

(c) a representative of the Central Board for the Prevention 

! and Control of Air Pollution referred to in section 3 of the Air 
14 of 1981. (Prevention and Control of Pollution) Act, 1981; 

(d) a representative of the State Board appointed under 
section 4 of the Water (Prevention and Control of Pollution) 

6 of 1974, Act, 1974; 

(e) a representative of the State Board for the Prevention 
and Control of Air Pollution referred to in section 5 of the Air 

140f 1981. (Prevention and Control, of Pollution) Act, 1981; 

(f) a representative of the Department of Environment in 
the State; 

(g) a representative of the Meteorological Department of the 
Government of India; I 

I 

,(h) an expert in the field of occupational health; and 

(i) a representative of the Town Planning Department of the 
State Government, 

and cot more than five other members who may be co-opted by tho 
State Government who shall be- 

(i) a scientist having specialised knowledge of the hazardous 
process which will be involved in the factory, 

(ii) a representat.ive of the local authority within whose 
jurisdiction the factory is to be established, and 

(iii) not more than three other persons as deemed fit by 
the State Government. 

\ 

(2) The Site Appraisal Committee shall examine an applica- 
tion for the establishment of a factory involving hazardous process 
and mak'e its recommendation to the State Government within a 
period of ninety days of the receipt of such application in the pres- 
cribed form, 12,.l 

(3) Where any process relates to a factory owned or controlled 
%ay the Central Government or to a corporation or a cumpany owned 
or controlled by the Central Government, the State Government 
shall co-opt in  the Site Appraisal Committee a representative nomi- 
nated by the Central Government as a member ef that Committee. 

(4) The Site Appraisal Committee shall have power to call for 
any information fibin the person making an application for the 
establishment -or expansion of a factory involving a hazardous 
pl;ocess. 

(5) Where the State Government has granted approval to an 
application for the establishdent or expansion of a factory involving 

I a hazardous process, it shall not be necessary for an applicant to 
obtain a further approval from the Central Board or the State Board 
established unde'r the Water (Prevention md control of Pollution) 

6 of 1974. Act, 1974 and th& Air (Prevention and Control of Pollution) Act, 
14 af 1981. 1Q81. 

68 LdW-35. 



Cbmpul- 
sory 

disclosure 
@f informa 
tion by the 
occupier. 

Fwtories {Amendment) 

41B. (13 The accupier of e v e q  factory involving a hazardous 
process shall disclose in the manner prescribed all information re- 
garding dangers, includhg health hazsds and the measures to 
Dvercome such hazards arising from the exposure to or handling 
of the materials or subtances in the manufac-iure, transportation, 
storage and other processes, to the workers employed in the factory, 
the Chief Inspector, the local authority wntb;n whose jurisdiction the 
factory is situate and .the general public in the vicinity. 

(2) The occupier shall, at the time of registering the factory, 
involving a hazardous process, lay down a delailed policx with 
respect to the health and safety oi the workers employed therein and 
intimate such policy to the Chief Inspector and ;he local authority 
and, thereafter, at such intervals as may be prescribed, inlorrn the 
Chief hspectos and the locd authority of any change made in the 
said policy. 

i j- -,. 
(3) The information furnished under sub-section (1) si;"a'c - .  

include accurate information as to the quantity, specifications and 
other c~haracteristics of wastes and t,he mamer of their disposal. 

(4) Every occupier shall, with the appr~val  o£ the Chief Inspec- 
tor, draw up an on-site emergency plzn a d  detailed asaster control 
measures lor his f a ~ t o - ~  and make knov~n to tlie workers ernployed 
ihereir~ and t~ the general public living iQ the vicinity of the factory 
the safety measures required to be taken in ' c t ~  e v c n ~  o i  m a.ccidemt 
taking place. 

15) Every occupier of a faclory shall,-- 

@) if such factory engaged ill a. hazlirdous grciccss on the 
commencenent of the Factories (&nenQment) Act, 1981, within 
a period of thirty days of such commencemeni; and 

(b )  if such factory proposes to engage in a hazardous process 
at any time after such commencement, within a period of thirty 
days before the ccammeilcement of such process, 

inform the Chief Inspector of the nature and details of the process in 
such form and in such manner as may be prescribed. 

( 6 )  Where any occupies of a factory coatraveaes the provisions 
of sub-section (5), the licence issued under section 6 to such factory 
shall, notwithstanding any penalty to which the occupier or factorgrg 
shall be subjected to under the ~rovisions of this Act, be liable for 
cancellationn 

(7) The occupier of a factory involving a hazardous process shall, 
with the previous approval of the, Chief Inspector, lay down measures 
for the handling, usage, transportatiorl and storage of hazardous 
substances inside the factory premises and the disposal of such. 
substances outside the factory premises and publicise them in the 
manner prescribed anlong the workers and the general public livialg 
in the vicinity. . , .+* 



OF 19871 Factories (Aw,endment) 265 

4l@. Every occ~a.pier of a factory involving any hazardous process 
,I shall- . ,. 

(a) rnailltain accurate and up-to-date health records or, as the 
case may be, medical records, mf the workers in the factory who 
are ex!msed to anmy che~nical, toxic or any other harmful suh- 
stances w1:ich ;!-.:I msnuQacl:xred, stored, handled or transported 
and slicb reccrds sllall he a-ccessible to the workers subject to such 
co~~diiioils as iilay be prescribed; 

(b) app3Ji?T: persons who possess qualifications and experience 
In handling hazardous substances and are competent to supervise 
such har7d:ing within the factory and to provide at the workimg 
place al l  the necessary facilities for protecting the workers in 
the lnclnlzev prescribed: I 

Provided that where any question arises as to the qlxalifica- 
tiails acd experie~?ce of a person so appointed, the decision of the 
Chief Inspector s'nsl! be final; 

(c) provide for  medical exam.inatian of every worker- 

(a) before such wcirker js assigned to a job involving the 
handling of, or  worldng with, a hazardous substance, and 

( b )  while 'continuing in such Job, and after he has 
ceased to work ia such job, at  intervals not exceeding .twelve 

months, in such manner as may be prescribed. 

4173. ( 1 )  The Central Government may, in the event of the occur- 
rence of an eic'Lraordinary situation involving a factory engaged in a 
hazardous process, appoint an Inquiry Committee to inquire iPlta the 

- A  standards of haslth and safety observed in the factory with a view 
to finding cut the causes of any failure or neglect in the adoption of 
any m$a.sv.res or  standards prescribed for the health and safety of the 
workers empioyed 111 the factory or the general public affected, or 
likzlv to be aRected, due to such failure or neglect and for the pre- 
ventfun and recurrence of such extraordinaq situations in future in 
such factmy or elsewhelra. 

!> 

(2)  The Committee appointed under sub-section (I) shd l  consfst 
of a Chairman azid two other members and the terms of reference 
of the Committee and the tenure of office of its members shall be 
such ar;  PIS^ be 22-ternlined by the Central Government according 
to the req~lirements of the situation. 

(3) r ac s~~xezda t ions  af the Committee shall be advisory in 
nature. 

41E. ( I )  S77i:cre tb.e 'Central Gover:nment is ,satisfied that no stan- 
da!:ds *of safety have been prescribed in respect of a hazardous pro- 
cess o:r class of h~zardous  ~ O C ~ S S P S ,  or where the standards so pres- 
cribed' arc inadeq:,~ate. it: 1i?a: direct the Director-General of Fac!ory 
Advice Serv>ce and P,abour Institutes cr any institution specfa/iscd 
ir? matters relating to stanulzrde of safety in hazardous processes, to 
lay d o w ~  mergencg. standapds %or claforcement of witable standards 
In respcc.!S of slxch hazardo1.1~ processes. 

. . 

Specific 
responsi- 
bility of I 
t he  occu- 1 
pier in re- 

I 

lation to I 

hazardous 
processes, i 

J 

Power of 
Central 
Govern- 
ment to 
appoint 
Inquiry 
Com- 
mittee, 

Emr-* 1 

gency 
standards, 



2 6,6 Pnctwies (Amendment) [ACT 20 

(2) The emergency standards laid down uuder sub-seetion (1) 
shall, until they are incorporated in the rules made under this Act, 
be enforceable and have the same effect as if they had k e n  incor- 
porated in the rules made under this Act. 

Permissi- 
ble limits 
of 
exposure 
of chemi- 
cal and 
toxic sub- 
jtances. 

Workers' 
partici- 
pation 
in safety 
manage- 

ment. 

Right a£ 
workers 
to warn 
ahout 
imminent 
danger. 

Amend- 
ment of 
section 
64. 

413'. (1) The maximum permissible threshold limits of exposure 
of chemical and toxic substances in manufacturing processes (whether 
hazardous or otherwise) in aRy factory shall be of the value indicated 
in the Second Schedule. Q 

42) The Central Government may, at any time, for the purpose 
of giving effect to any scientific proof obtained from specialised 
institutions or experts in the field, by notification in the Official 
Gazette, make suitable changes in the said Schedule. 

-- 

41G. (I) %he occupier shall, in every factory where a hazardous 
process takes place, or where hazardous substances are used or 
handled, set up a Safety Committee consisting of equal number of 
representatives of workers and management to promote cooperation 
between the workers and the management in maintaining proper 
safety and health at work m d  to review periodically the measures 
taken in that behalf: 

Provided that the State Government may, by order in WrltfYlg 
and for reasons to be recorded, exempt the occupier of any factory 
GT class of factories from setting up sych Committee. 

(2) The cornpositi~n of the Safety Committee, the tenure of 
office of its members and their sights and duties shall be such as may 
be. prescribed. 

4fH. (I) Where the worlsers employed in any factory engaged in 
a hazardous process have reasmable appreheasion that there is a 
likelihood of imminerzt danger to their lives or health due to any 
accident, Vney may bring the same to the notice of the occupier, 
agent, manager- or any other person who is incharge of the -factory 
or the process concerned directly or through their representatives 
in the Safety Committee and simultaneously bring the same to the 
notice of the Inspector. 

(2) It  shall be the duty of such occupier, agent, manager or the 
,person incharge of the factory or process to take immediate remedial 
action if he is satisfied about the existence of such imminent danger 
and send a report forthwith of the action taken to the nearest 
Inspector. 

43) If the occupier, agent, manager or the person imcharge 
referred to in sub-section (2) is not satisfied about the existence of 
any imminent danger as apprehended by the workers, he shall, 
nevertheless, refer the matter forthwith to the nearest Inspector 
whose decision on the question of the existence of such imminent 
danger shall be final.". 

21. In section 64 of the prjncipal Act, in the proviso to sub-section (I), 
for the words "does not exceed rupees seven hundred and fifty per month", 
the words, brackets afid figures "does not exceed the wage limit specified 
in sub-section (6) of section I of the Payment of Wages Act, 1936, as 
z~nefided from time to time" shall be substftuted. 



.g. In section 70 of the principal Act,- Amend- 
ment of 

(a)  in sub-section (I) ,  the proviso and the Expbanation shall be section70, 
omitted; 

(b) after sub-section (I),  the following sub-sectioiz shall be 
inserted, namely: - 

I I 

" (1A) No female adolescent or a male adolescent who has 
not attained the age of seventeen years but who has been grant- 
ed a certificate of fitness to work in a factory as an adult, shall 
be required or a k w e d  to work in any factory except between 
6 A.M. and 7 P.M.: 

Provided that the State Government may, by notification in 
the Official Gazette, in respect of any factory or group or class 
or description of factories,- 

(i), vary the limits laid down in this sub-section so, how- 
ever, that no such section shall authorise the employment 
of any female adolescsnt between 10 P.M. and 5 A.M.; 

(ii) grant exemption from the provisions of this su& 
section in case of serious emergency where national interest 
is involved.". I 

23. In section 71 of the principal Act, after sub-section (43, the follow- 
k g  ,~~b-sect4on,shall be inserted, namely: - 
', 

"(5) No female child shall be required or allowed to work in 
any factory except between S A.M. and 7 P.M.". 

24. In section 80 of the principal Act, in subsection '(1))- 

(a) for the words "shall be paid", the words "shall be entitled to 
wages" shall be substituted; 

( b )  the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:- 

"Provided that in the case of a worker who has not worked 
on any day during the calendar month immediately preceding 
his leave, he shall be paid at a rate equal to the daily average 
of his total full time earnings for the days on which he actuaIly 
worked. during the last calendar montll preceding his leave, in 
which he actually worlced, exclusive of any overtime and bonus 
but inclusive of dearnws allowance and the cash equivalent of 
the advantage accruing through the concessional sale to the 
workers of foodgrains ~ n d l  other articles.". 

25. In section 87 of the principal Act, clause (g)  shall be okitted. 

26. After section 87 of the principal Act, the following section shall 
be inserted, namely: - [ 

"87A. (I) Where it appears to the Inspector that conditions in,  a 
factory or part thereof are such that they may cause serious hazard 
by way of injury or death to the persons employe? therein or to 
the general public in the vicinity, he may, by order in writing to 
the occupier of the factory, state the particulars in respect of which 
he considers the factory or part thereof to be thz cause of such 

Amend- 
ment of 
section 
71. , 

Amend- 
ment of 
section 80. 

Amend- 
ment of 
section; 87. 
Insertj~n, ,of, 
new section 
87A. 

Power to 
prohibit 
employ- 
ment on 
account 
of serious 
hazard. 



Factories (Arn~nament) [ACT 20. 

serious hazard and prohibit ~ u c h  occupier from eniploying any 
person in ihe factory or any part thereof other than the mininlum 
number of persons necessary to attend to the minirr~um tasks till , 

the hazard is removed. 

(2) Any order issued by the Inspector under sub-section (1) shall 
have eflecl for  a period of three days until extended by the Chief 
Inspec~tor by a subsequent order. 

(3) Any person aggrieved by an order of the Inspector under 
7 sub-section ( I ) ,  and the Chief 'laspector under sub-section (21, shall 

hrrve the right to appeal to the High Court. 

1 (4) Any person whose employment has been affected by an order 

1 I 
issued under sub-section (I), sha l  be entitled to wages and other 
benefits and it shsll be the duty of the occupier to provide alternative 

! ennp1irry;nent to hfrn wherever possible and in the manner prescribed. 

(5) The provisions of sub-section (4) shall be without prejudice 
to the rights sf the parties under the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947.". , 

14 ef 1947. 

, Amend- 23. In secf,io.tl 89 of the principsl Act,- 
ment of 
section ( i )  for kb,e words ('the Schedule", wherever they occur, the 
89. words '"he Third Schedulen shall be substituted; 

4ii3 in sub-section ( 4 ) ,  for the words "fifty rupees", the words 
"one thousand mpees" shall be substituted; 

(2%) after sub-section ( 4 ) ;  the following sub-section shall be 
1 added, namely: - 

'<(5) The Central Government may, by notification in the 
0fficin.E Gazette, add to or alter the Third Schedule and ar?y s!~ch 
addleion or aJ.t.teration shall have effect as  if it had been mads 
by thls Act.". 

Amend- 28. In section SO of the principal Aet, in sub-section ( I ) ,  for the wcrds 
ment of "the Schedule", the words "the Tbird Schedule" shall he substituted. 
section 90. 

Amend- 
ment of 
section 
9148. 

Amend- 
ment of 
section. 92, 

29. Xn section 94A of the priilcipal Act,, after sub-section 431, the 
f~llowing Explanation shall be inserted, namely: -- 

g'E.qEanatian.-For the purposes QP this section? the report, if any, 
submitted to the State Government by the person conducting the 
suavey under sub-section (I) shall be deemed to be a report submitted 
by a"n Inspector under this Bet.". I 

30. Tn section 92 of the principal Act,-- 

(a)  for the words "three months", the words "two years" shall 
be substituted; , 

48) for the words "two thousand rupees", the words "one lakt  
Pupees" shall be substituted; 

( c )  for  the words "seventy-five rupees9', the words thousand 
r~pecs" shall be substituted; 

(d )  for thc words "one thoizsand rupees", the words "twenty- 
five thoussnd rupees" shall be svbstitukd: 



I OR 119871 Factories (Amendment) I 269 

(e) for the words "five hundred rupees", the words "five 
thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

\ 

3-1. In section 94 sf the principal Act, in sub-section (I) ,- Amend- 
' ment of 

(i) for the words "six months", the words, "three years" shall be Secti0n94* 

substituted; 

(ii) for the words "two hundred rupees", wherever they occur, 
the words "tea t.housand rupees" shall be substituted; 

(iii) for the words "five thousand rupees", the words ,"two Ed& 
rupeesn shall be substituted; 

(iv) for the words "two thousand rupees", the words "thirty-five 
thousand rupees" shall be substituted; 

(v) for the words "one thousand rupees", the words "ten 
thousand rupees" shall be substituted, , 

32. In section 95 of the princjpal Act, for the words "three months" Amend- 
and "five hundred rupees", the words "six months" and "Sen thousand mentof 

rupees" shall, respectively, be substituted. section 
95. 

33. In section 96 of the principal Act, for the words "three months" 
and "five hundred rupees", the words "six months" and "ten thousand 
rupees" shall respectively, be substituted. 

34, After section 96 of the principal Act, the following section shall 
be inserted, namely: - 

'96A. (1) ~ ~ l ~ o e i c x  fails to comply with or contra~;,lenes any of 
the provisions of section 41B, 41C or 4 1 3  or the ruks made there- 
under, shall, in respect of such failure or contravention, be punish- 
able with imprisonment for a term which may extend to seven years 
and with fine which may extend to two labh rupees, and in case the 

failure or contravention continues, with additional fine which may 
extend to five thousand rupees for every day during which such 
failure or contravention conti~ues after the convjction for the fucst 
such failure or contravention. 

(2) If the failure or contravention referred to in sub-section (1) 
continues beyond a period of one year after the date of conviction, the 
offender shall be punishable with imprisonment for a term which may 
extend to ten years.". B P 

35. In section 97 of the principal Act, in sub-section ( I ) ,  for the words 
"twenty rupees", the words "five hundred rupees" shall be substituted. 

36. In secticm 98 of the principal Act, for the words "one n~onth" and 
"fifty  rupee^'^, the words "two months" and "one thousand rupees" shall, 
respectively, be substituted. 

37. In section 99 of the principal Act, for the words "fifty ruyaes'', the 
words " ~ n e  thousand rupees" shall be substitute,d. 

Amend: 
ment of 
section 
96. 

~nserti;? 
of new , 

Sf ction 

Penalty 
for c02.z 
traven- 
tion of 
the pro- 
visions , 

of sec- 
tions 
41B, 4161 
and 41H. 

Amend- 
ment of 
section 97. 

Amend- 
ment of 
section 98. 

Amend- ' 

ment (P% 
section 99, 



270 Fciebries (Amendment) [ACT 20 

Omission 38, Section 100 of the principal Act shall be omitted. 
of section 

100. 

Iriset.tlon 39. After section 104 of the pmcipal Act, the following section shall 
oft n*w be inserted, namely: - 
section I - "  t 

104A. 

Onus "lMA. In any proceeding for an offence for the contravention 
of prov- of any provision of this Act or rules made thereunder consisting of a ing limits 
of what is failure to comply with a duty or requirement to do something, it 
practicable, shall be for the person who is alleged to have failed to comply 
etc. with such duty or requirement, to prove that i t  was not reasonably 

practicable or, as the case may be, all practicable measures were 
taken to satisfy the duty or requirement.". 

Insertion 40. In: Chapter X of the principal Act, after section 106, the following 
of new section shall be inserted, namely': - 
section 
106A. 

Jurigdiktion 
ofC$ cam 
for enter- 
taining 

p't&eeed- 
ings,'etc., 
fdf 'offence. 

Insertion 
of ne* 
s66tidn' 
1 i lX. 

Right 
of utorkers, 
e k  

Anlend. ' 
ment of 
section 115. 

"1OGk. For the purposes of conferring jurisdiction on any court 
in relation to an offence under this Act or the rules made thereunder 
in connection with the operation of any plant, the place where the 
plant is for the time being situate shall be deemed to be the place 
where such offence has been committed.". 

L 

41. After section 111 of the principal Act, the following section shall 
b'e inserted, namely: - 

I 

"111A. Every worker shall have the right to- 

(i) obtain from the occupier, information relating to 
workers' health and safety at work, 

(ii) get trained within the factory wherever possible, or, to 
get himself sponsored by the occupier for getting trained at a 
training centre or institute, duly approved by the Chief 
Inspector, where training is irnparted for workers' health and 
safety at work, = L&. z ; 

, (iii) represent to the Inspector directly or through his 
representative in the mattea of: inadequate provision for protee- 
tion of his health or safety in the factory.". 

42, Section 115 of the principal Act shall be renumbered as sub 
section (1) thereof, and,-- 

( a )  in sub-section (1) as so re-numbered, for the words "three 
months", tlze words "forty-five days" shall be substituted; 

(b) after sub-section (1) as so re-numbered, the following sub 
section shall be inserted, namely:.- 

"(2) Every rule made by the State Government unaer this 
Act shall be laid, as soori as may be after it is made, before the 

State Lcgi~lature.~'. , I 



b~ i'g871 Faejories (Arnehdaen;e). 271;. , 

43. After section 118 of the principal Act, the following section shall Insertion 
be inserted, namely: - 

I 
' of new 6 d s i T a 4  

section 
118.4. 

"118A. (1 )  Every Inspector shall treat as confidential the source Restrice 

of any complaint brought to his notice on the breach of any provision O n  
dis- 

of this Act. closure 
of infor- 

(2) No inspector shall, while making an inspection under this mation. 
Act, disclose to the occupier, manager or his representative that the 
inspection is made in pursuance of the receipt of a complaint: 

Provided that nothing: in this sub-section shall apply to any case 
in which the person who has made the complaint has consented to 
disclose his name.". 

44. In section 119 of the principal Act, the words "or any other faw *,end- 
for the time belng in force" shall be inserted at the end. - ment of 

section 
119. 

45. Before the Schedule to the principal Act, the following Schedu:es Insertion 
shall be inserted, namely: - of new 

Sche. 
dules. 

"THE FIRST SCHEDULS 

[See section 2 (cb) 

LIST OF INDUSTRIES INVOLVING HAZARDOUS PROCESSES 

1. Ferrous Metallurgical Industdes 

-Integrated Iron and Steel 

-Ferro-alloys: 

-Special Steels 

2. Non-ferrous MetallurgiCal Industries 

-Primary Metallurgical Industries, namely, zinc, lead, copper, manganese and aluminium 

3. Foundries (ferrous and notl-ferrous) 

-Castings and forgings including cleanins or smoothening/rougbeninp by s a ~ d  and shot 
blasting 

4. Coal (including coke] industries 

- Coal, Lignite, Coke, etc. 

--Fuel Gases (including Coal Gas, Producer Gas, Water Gas) 

5. Power Generating ~ndustties 

6. Pulp and paper (includadi:~g paper products) industries 

8. Fertiliser Industries 

-Nitregcartsars 

-- Phosphatic 



b72. Fac$wias (Amendment)  ACT $0 - 

8. C%menbJn.dyqt$as 

-Portland Crment (including slag cement, pueolona cement an& thei6 Products 

9. Petroleum Industries 

-Oil Refining 

-~ubricati 'n~ d i g  and' Greases 

10. Petro-chemical Industries 

11 .: Drugs and Pharmaceutical Industries 

-Narcotics, Drugs and ~harmaceuticals 

12. Fermentation Industries @istilleries.and Breweries) 

13. Rubber (Synthetic) Industries 

j4. paints and Pigment Industries 

- 15. Leather Tanning Industries 

16. Electro-plating Industries 

1% Chemical Industries 

--%Ice Oven By-products and Coaltar Distillation products 

--coal lust rial Gases (njtrogen, oxygen, acetylene, argon, carbmdioxide, hydrogen, sulphur 
dioxid'e; nitious ox~de, halogenated hydrocarbon, ozone, etc.) 

-Industrial Carbon 

-Alkalies and-Acids 

-Chromtes and dichromtes 

--had and its co~~ipounds 

~ ~ l e c t r ~ h e i ~ l i c a l ~  (metallic sodium, potassiuin and magnesium, chlorates, perchhates 
and peroxides) 

-Electrothsr~al projiloes (artificial abrdsive, calciuln carbide) 

*Nitrogenous colnpounds (cyanides, cyanamides, and other nitrogenous a n j p w d s ) '  

-Phosphorous and its comwunds 

--Halogens and Halogenated compounds (Chlorine, Fluorine, Bromine and Iodino) 

-Explosives (including industrial explosives and detonatms and fuses) 

is. Insecticides, Fungicides, Herbicides and other Pesticides IadustPies 

19. Synthetic Resin and Plastics 

20. Man-made Fibre (Gllulosic and non-cellulosic) Industry 

21. Manufacture and revair of electrical a~umula tors  

22. Glass and Ceramics 

23. Qrindi~ig or glazing of metals 

24. Manufadure, handling and processing of asbestos and its ~roduc ts  

25. Extraction of oils and fats from vegetable and animal sources 

26. Manufwture, handli*lg and use of benzene and substances containing b e m n e  

27. Manufacturjng processes and operations involving carbon disulphide 

28. Dycs and Dyestuff including their intermediata 

29, HighIy flammable liquids and gases. 



THE SECOND SCHEDULE 
(See section 41F) 

PERMISSIBLE LEWLS OF CmTAIN CHEMICAL SUBSTANCES IN WOW 
ENVIRONMENT 

-. --- - ^- -- --- ------ --,. 

Substance - ; 

Permissible limits of expbsure 
Time-weiglked Short-term 

average concentsat ion exposure limit 
(8 h s )  (15 "in) * 

. . . . .  Acetaldehyde 100 1 80 190 270 

AldrIn-skin . . .  
AUyl Chloride . . .  
Ammenla . . .  

. . .  Anillnwskln 

Anisidhe (0-,Pisonas)--skin 

Arserdc & compounds (as As) 

I3enzene. . . .  
Beryllium. . . .  
Bornon Trifluoride . . 
Bromine . . . .  
Butane . . . . . .  
2 Butanon (Methylethyle K~~O~C-MEK) ,~  

-u-Butyl acetate . . .  
. . .  n-Butylalcohol-skin 

. . .  secjtert. Butyl acetate 

Butyl Macaptan . . . .  
Cadmium-dust and salts (as Cd) . . .  

Calcium oxide:. . . a 

Carbaryl(sevin) . . . 
. . .  Carbofuran  fura ad an)^ 

. . .  Carbon disulphide-skin 

Carbon monoxide . . .  
I@ . . .  Carbon to trachloddeslcin 

Cacboayl moride (Phosgene), . 
w - - 



' ' '274 Factories (Amendment) 

Cldmohenzene (n~mochloro-benzene) . 75 3 50 . . . . 
Chloridane-skin . , , . . .  . . 0-  5 . . 2 

Chlorine . . . . . . . .  1 3 3 9 

Chlbroform . . . . .  18 50 50 225 

chromic acid and chromates (as Cr) . . .  . . 0.03 . -  . a 

Chrornous Salts (as Cr) . . . . .  . . 0.05 * .  . . 
CopIjer fume . . . .  . . .  . . 0 . 2  , .  . - 
Cotton dust, raw . . . , . A  . . 0 . 2  . . 0.6 

%mol, all isomers--skin . . .  
Cyanides (tis CN)-skin . . . 
Cyanogen . . , . . 

A ,  DDT @ich!orodiphcnyl Trichloroethctle) 
Demeton---skin . , . 
Diazinon-skin , . , 

DibutylPhythalate;. . a 

Dichlorvos (DDVP)-skin . . 
Bieidrin-skin . . . . .  
Dinitiobenzene (all isomers)-skin , 

Dinitrotoluene-skin . . . .  
Diophenyl . . . . . .  
Endosulfan (Thiodan)-skin . . 

Ethylacetate . . , , . 
Ethylalcohol . . , . . 
Ethylemin . . . .  
Flouridcs (as F) . . . .  

. . . . . .  Nourine 

. . . . .  Porlnic Acid 

Hydrazine-skin . . . 
Hydrogen Chloride . . .  C5 C 7  , . . . 

. . . . .  Hydrogen Flouride (as F) 3 2.5 6 5 

HydrogenPeroxide . . . . . .  I 1.5  2 3 

. . . . . . . .  Gasoline 300 900 so0 1500 

Iodine . . CO.1 C1 . . . , 
Iron Oxide Fume (l?eaO,) (as Fe) . . .  . . 5 . . 10 

. . .  Isoamyl acetets . . 100 525 125 655 



Fac$ories (Amendment) 

. . .  Isobutyl aloohol . . .  50 150 75 225 

Lead, inor$, fumes and dusts (as Pb) . . .  . . 0.15 . . 0.45 

Manganese (as Mn) qust and ComWu~ds . . . . C05 . o  . . 
. . .  Fume . . .  . . 1 . . 0.3 

i 

Mercury (as Hg) -skin Alkyl compounds . . . ,  0.01 . . 0.03 

All forms except alkyl vapour . . . .  . . 0.05 . . " .  
Aryl and inorganic wmpounds . . . .  . . 0.1 . . . . 

- '  ' Methyl alcohol (methbno1)- skin . . , 200 260 250 310 

5 ' 1 6  Methyl cellosolve-skin (2 methoxy ethanol) . . . . . 
Methyl isobutyl Ketone--skin . a . . 50 205 79 3 00 

Nickel carbonyl (as Ni) . . . . .  0.03 0.35 . . . . 
Nitric acid . . . .  

. . . .  Nitric oxide 

. . .  Nitrobenzene--skin 

Nitrogen dioxide . , . 

Phorate (Thimet)--skin- . . 
Phosgone (Carbonyt Chloride) . 
Phospbine . . . .  
P h o s p h o ~ s  (yellow) : . . 
Phosphorus pentachloride 

Phosphorus trichloride . . 
. . .  Picric acid -skin, 

Pyridine . . , . . 
Silane (silicon tetrahydride) . 

. . .  Sodium hydroxide 

Symne, monomer (pknylethylene) 

Sulphur dioxide 



--- 4 

ppm mg/ma ppm mdms 

---- -- -. - --. 

Sulphur hekafluoride i . . . .  lo00 6000 1250 ,7500 

Sulphuric>acid . . . . . . .  . . 1 . .  . . 
(roluene(Tu1uol) . . . . .  fbo 975 1 SO 560 

o-Tulufdine-skin . . . , . . 2 9 . . . . 
Tributylphosphate . . . . . . 0- a 2.5 0.4 5 

Triehloroethylene . . . . . . 50 270 200 1080 

Uranium, natural(as U) . . . . . . . 0.2 , . 0.5 

Vinyl chloride . . . . . , .  S 10 . 
Welding fumes . . , . . .  . s 5 . . . . 
Xylene (0-,,m-, P-isomers) . . . . . t i  43.5 150 655 

Zironium compound3 (as Zr) . . . .  , > 5 .. . 10 

C denotes cei1in.g Hpit. 

*Not more than 4 times a day with at least GO ma. interval Betwean suqcrassive 
exposures. 

I 

SuBstance Perlnissible time-seig'hted average .wncaotration 
(8 honre) 

- I d  .. d . 0 .  ------ -- 
(i) Silica 

\ 

(a) Castalline 

(b) Quartz 

(1) In terms of dust count ---- --- .. - .- - ---- m p m  
% Quartz+- 10 

10 
(2) termsof respirable dust - - - - .- -- - -- - - - - - -- - - mg/ma 

% respirable quartz f 2 

to 
(3) In terms of total dust - - - .- . - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - mg/m8 

% quartz+-3 

(ii) Gdstabalite . . . . Half the limits given against quartz. 

(iii3 Tridymite . . , . . Half the limits given against quartz. 

(iv) Silica fused . . . . Same limit as for quartz. 

(,,) (a) Tripoli . . . . Same limit as in formula in itotu 2 g h 1  against qur tz .  

(b) Amorphous . . , . 705 mppcm.". 



OF 19871 Factories (Amendment) 279 

46. The existing Schedule to the principal Act shall be re-numbered Amend- 
as the Third Schedule and in the Third Schedule as so re-numbered, ment of 
after entry ;'22", the following entries shall be iaserted, namely:- the 

exist- 

, "23. Beriyl'lium poisoning, h g  Sdhedule . 
24. Carbon monoxide, 

25. Coal miners' pneumoconiosis, 

26. Phosgene poisoning, 

27. Occupational cancer, 

28. Isocyanates poisoning, , 

29. Toxic nephritis.". 


