THE MOTOR VEHICLES (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1994

No. 54 or 1994

[10¢th September, 1994.]
An Act further to amend the Motor Vehicles Act, 1988.

Be it enacted by Parhament in the Fomy-ﬁfth Year of the Repubhc
of India as follows: — |

1, (1) This Act may be called the Motor Vehicles (Amendment) Act,
1994,

]

(2) It shall come into force on such date1 as the Central Govermnent
may, by notification in the Official Gazette, appomt and d1ﬁ’erent dates
may be appointed for different provisions of this Act and any reference
in any such provision to the commencement of this Act shall be constru-
ed as a reference to the coming into force of that provision.

59 of 1988, 2. In section 2 of the Motor Vehicles Act, 1988 (hereinafter referred
~ to as the principal Act),—

i

¢} in clause (8), sub-clause (a) shall be omitted;

() in clause (21), for the figure “6000”, the | figure “'7500”
shall be substituted;

(i) after clause (21), the followmg clause shall be 1nserted .

nameiy —_

‘(ZIA) “manufacturer” means a person whg is engaged in thez‘

manufacture of motor vehicles:’;

(iv) in clause (28), for the words “thirty-five cubic centimetres”

occurring at the end, the words “twenty-ﬁ,ve cubie centjmetres” shall
be substltuted

(v), for clause (39), the following clause shall be substituted,
nameiy —

°(39) “semi-trailer” means a vehiele not mechanically pro-
pelled (other than a trailer), which is intended to be connected to
a motor vehicle and which is so constructed that a portion of it is

" super-imposed on, and a part of whose weight is borne by, that
motor vahxcle, s

l4~11 1994 Vide Nt‘hf:catlon No. S§. S. 728(B), dt. 6-10-1994.

573 ..

Short
title and
com-
mence-
ment,

Amend .

ment of
section 2.



Amend-
ment of
section 3,

Amend-
ment of

section 4.

Amend-
ment of

section 7.

Amend-
ment of
section
8.

Amend-
ment of
seetion

9.

574 Motor Vehicles (Amendment) [acT 54

(vi) in clause (42), after sub-clause (iii), the following sub-
clause shall be inserted, namely:—

" “(iv) Zilla Parishad or any other similar local authority.”.

3. In section 3 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the words
“a motor cab”, the words “a motor cab or motor cycle” shall be substitu-
ted.

. 4. In section 4 of the principal Act, in sub-section (I), in the proviso,
for the words “a motor cycle without gear”, the words “a motor cycle
with engine capacity not exceeding 50cc” shall be substituted.

5. In section 7 of the principal Act, for sub-section (1), the following
sub-section ghall be substituted, namely:—

“(I) No person shall be granted a learner’s hcence to drive a
transport vehicle unless he has held a driving licence to drive a
light motor vehicle for at least one year.”. ‘

6. In section 8 of the principal Aét after sub-section (3), the follow-

. ing proviso shall be add.ed namely —

“Provxded that no such medlcal certificate is requu'ed for ]icence
to drive a vehicle other than a transport vehicle.” .

- 1. Tn section 9 of the principal Act,—

(@) for sub-section (3), the following - shall be substituted,
namely:—

“(3).If the applicant passés such test as may be prescribed by
the Central Government, he shall be issued the driving licence:

Provided that no such test shall be necessary where the appli-
cant produces proof to show that—

(2) (i) the a,pplu.a“lt has previously he]d a dnvmcr licence
to drive such class of vehicle snd that the period hetween the
date of expiry of that licence and the date of the application

~does not exceed five years, or

(i) the applicant holds or has previously held a driving
licence to drive such class of vehicle issued under section 18, or

(ii1) the applicant holds a driving licence to drive such

class of vehicle issued by a competent authority of any country

‘outside India, subject to the condition that the applicant com-
plies with the provisions of sub-section (3) of section 8,

(b) the applicant s not suffering from any disability
which is likely to cause the driving by him to be'a’'source of
danger to the public; and the licensing authority may, for that
purpose, require the apphcant to produce a medical certificate
in the same form and in the same manner as is referred to in
sub-section (3) of section 8:



oF 1994] Motor Vehicles (Amendment) 575

Provided further that where the application is for a driv-

ing licence to drive-a motor vehicle (not being a transport

vehicle), the licensing authority may exempt the applicant

from the test of competence to drive a vehicle prescribed un-

der this sub-section, if the applicant possesses a driving certi-

ficate issued by any institution recognised in this behalf by
the State Government.”.

(b) for sub-sectlon (5), the following sub- sectlon shall be substi-
tuted, namely:—

“(5) Where the applicant does mot pass the test; he may be
permitted to re-appear for the test after a period of seven days:

Provided that where the applicant does not pass the test even
after three appearances, he shallnot be qualified to re-appear for

such test before the expiry of a period of sixty days from the date
of last such test.”.

8. In section 10 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), for clauses  Amend-

(e) to (h), the following clause shall be supstituted, namely:— ment of
: ' section
“(e) transport vehicle;”, e e 10.
9. In section 14 of the principal Act, in sub—secﬁon ’(2),—-— | Amend-

. . ment of

(i) in sub-clause (@), the word “and” shall be omitted, and after  section
clause (a) as so amended, the’ follow1ng proviso shall be inserted, 14
namely:— '

“Provided that in the case of licence to drive g trgnsport vehi-
cle carrying goods of dangerous or hazardous nature be effective
for a period of one year and renewal thereof shall be subject to
the condition that the driver undergoes one day refresher

course of the prescribed syllabus; and”; '

(#) in clause (b),—

(4) in sub-clause (i), for the wbrds “forty‘yea'rs”, at the two
placeg where they occur; ‘the words “fifty years shall be substi-
tuted:

(b) for sub-clause (ii), the following clause shall be
substituted, namely:— '

“(i1) if the person referred to in sub-clause-(i), has
attained the age of fifty years on the date of issue or as the
case.-may be, renewal thereof, be effective, on payment of such
fee as-may be prescribed, for a period of five years from the

_date of such issue or renewal;”.

10. In section 26 of the principal Act, in’ sub-section ‘(2), for the words Amend
“printed copy”, the words “printed copy or copy in such other form as the  ment of
' Central Government may require” shall be substituted. o section 26,

11. In section 41 of the prm"lpal Act, in sub-section (14), for the words  Amend-
. ®original registering authorlty”, the words “last reglstermg authonty” shall  ment of
be substituted. - - ' section 41.



576 Motor Vehicles (Amendment)  [act 34

Amend- '12. In section 43 of the principal Act,—
ment of ) ’ o - U
section 43, g “(a) in the proviso to sub-section (2), for the words “with a body”,

the words “with a body or any unforeseen clrcumstances beyond the
‘control of the owner” shall be substituted;

(b) after sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be inser-
ted, namely:—

“(3% In a case where the motor vehicle is held under hire-
purchase agreement, lease or hypothecation, the registering autho-
rity or other prescribed authority shall issue a temporary certifi-
cate of registration of such vehicle, which shall incorporate legibly
‘and prominently the full name and address of the person with
whom such agreement has been entered into by the ovner.”.

Amend- 13. In section 48 of the principal Act, after sub-section (5), the follow-
ment of ing sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—
section 48.

“(6) The owner of the vehicle shall also inform at the earliest, in
writing, the registering authority about the theft of his vehicle toge-
ther with the name of the police station where the theft report was
lodged, and the registering authority shall take into account such re-
port while disposing of any application for no objection certification,
registration, transfer of ownership or issue of duplicate registration
certificate.”.

Amend- 14. In section 51 of the principal Act,—
ment of '
aection $8; (@) in sub-section. (2),—

_ (7) for the words “original registering authority”, the words
“last registering authority” shall be substituted;

(i1) the following shall be added at the end, namely: —

“and. an intimation in this regard shall be sent to the original
registering authority if the last registering authority is not
the original registering authority”;

{b) in sub-section (3),—

(i) Tor the words “original registering autliority”, the words
“last registering authority” shall be subsututed ‘ '

(i1) the following shall be added at the end, namely —_

“and an Intimation in this behalf ghall be sent to the
original registering authority if the last registering authority
is not the original registering authority”;

{c¢) in sub-gection (5), after the words “taken possession of the
vehicle”, the words “from the registered owner” shall be inserted;

{d) in sub-section (6), for the words and figures “under section
47, make an application”, the words and figures “under section 47, or
removal of the vehicle to another State, or at the time of conversion of



or 1994] Motor Vehicles (Amendment) | 571

the vehicle from one class to another, or for issue of no objection cer-
tificate under section 48, or for change of residence or place of business
under section 49, or for the alteration of the vehicle under section 52,
make an application” shall be substituted;

(e) in sub-section (/0), afler the word “communicate”’, the weords
“by registered post acknowledgment due” shall be inserted;

(f) for sub-section (11, the following sub-sections shall be substi-
tuted, namely:— :

“(11y A registering authority registering the new vehicle, or
issuing the duplicate certificate of registration. or a no objection
certificate or a temporary certificate of registration, or issuing or
renewing, a fitness certificate or substifuting entries relating to
another motor vehicle in’the permit, shall intimate the financier

- of such transaction, ' ’

(12) The registering authority where it is not the original
registering authority, when making entry under sub-section (I)
or sub-section (2), or cancelling the said entry under sub-section
(3) orissuing the fresh certificate of registration under sub-section:
(5) shall communicate the same to the original registering autho-
rity,”. ‘ '

15. In secrtion 52 of the principal Act,—

(1) in sub-section (I), after the proviso, the following proviso shall
be inserted, namely:—~—

“Provided further that modification of the engine, or any part
thereof, of a vehicle for facilitating its operation by a different type
of fuel or source of energy including battery, compressed natural
gas, solar power or any other fuel or source of energy other than
liquid petroleum gas shall bhe treated as an alteration but that
shall be subject to such conditions as may be prescribed.”;

(i1) after sub-section (5), the following sub-section and Explana-
Hion shall be- inserted, namely:—

“(6y No person holding a vehicle under a hire-purchase agree-
ment shall make any alteration to the vehicle for which approval
of the registering authority is required under sub-section (I), ex-
cept with the written consent of the registered owner.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this section, “alteraticn”
means a change in the structure of a  vehicle which results in
change in its basic feature..

.16, In section 56 of the principal Act, after sub-section (4), the fol-
lowing proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided that no such canceliation shall be made by the prescrib-
-ed authority unless such prescribed authority holds such technical
qualification as may be prescribed or where the prescribed authority

Amen'd_
ment of
se_cti‘en 52,

Amend-
ment of
section
56.



Anend-
ment of

section 57.

Amend-

ment of
section
- 58,

Amend-
ment of
section
63,

Amend-
meng of
section
66,

Amend-
men: of

seption 64,

Amend-
ment of
section 8.

Amend-
ment of

section 71.

578 _ Motor Vehicles (Amendment) [ACT 54

does not hold such technical quanucauon on the basis of the report of
an officer having such qualifications.”.

17, In section 87 of the principal Act, for sub-section (1), the follow.
ing sub.section shall be substituted, namely:~

“(1) Any person aggrieved by an order of the registering autho-
rity under section 41, 42, 43, 45, 47, 48, 49, 50, 52, 53, 55 or 56 may,
within thirty days of the date on which he has received notice of such
order, appeal against the order to the prescribed authority.”.

18. In section 58 of the pri incipal Act, in sub-seciion (1), for the

words “maximum sofe laden weight”, the words “maximum gross vehicle
weight” shall be substituted.

19, In section 63 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), after the words
“shall supply to the Central Goversment”, the words “if so desired by it”
shall be inserted.

20. In section 66 of the principal Act,—

(i) in sub-section (2}, the following

proviso shall be added,
namely: —

“Provided that the helder of a permit of any articulated vehicle
may uge the prime-mover

7er of that articulated vehicle for any other
semi-{railor.”; ' ‘

(i) m sub-section (3). for clavse (1), the following clause shall be
substituted, namely: —— .

“(1) to any motoy vehicle which is operated by elecirie
battery, compressed natural gas or solar energy.”.

21. In section 67 of the princip al Act, in sub-section (1), after clause

{1), the following proviso shall be inserted, namelv:—

“Provided thet the fares and freights in respect of such stage carri-
ages, contract carriages and goods carriages operated by battery,
compressed natural

) gas or solar energy shall he fixed by the owner
or operator.”.

‘\1

22. In section 68 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3) after clauqe
{c}, the following clause shall be inserted, namel® -

¢ AUOT » ‘ .
(ca) Government to formulate routes for plying stage carriages:

23. In section 71 of the principal Act

L,

{2} ‘the proviso to sub-section {I) shall he omitted:

(b) in sub-section (3), in the provise to clause {d) —

(i} in clause (77,) , the word ©

R7l - N " R
. ), the word “or”, occurring at the end, shall ha
omitie d S )



or 1994] Motor Vehicles (Amendment) 570

(i) in clause (iii), the word “or” shall be inserted at the end,
and after clause (iii) as so amended, the following clause shall be
inserted, namely: -~

“(iv) any other class or category of persons, as the State
Government may, for reasons to be recorded in writing con-
sider necessary.”;

(¢Y sub-sections (4) and (5) shall be omitted.

24. In section 75 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the words
motor cabs to persons desiring to drive the cabs”, the words “motor
cabs or motor cycles to persons desiring to drive either by themselves or
through drivers, motor cabs or motor cycles” shall be substituted.

25, In section 80 of the principal Act, for the words “Regional Trans-
port Authority”, wherever they occur, the wordg “Regional Transport
Authority, State Transport Authority or any prescribed authority referred
to in sub-section (I) of section 66” shall be substituted.

26. In section 81 of the principal Act insub-section (I), for the ‘words

“without renewal”, the words “from the date of issuance ox renews: \1 there-
of” shall be substituted.

27. In section 88 of the principal Act—

(@) in sub-section (8), for the words “grant a special permit in
‘relation to a vehicle covered”, the words “grant a special permit to
any public service vehicle including any vehicle covered” shall  be
substituted:

(b) in sub-section (9), for the word and figures “and 89", the
words, brackets, letter and figures “clause (d) of sub-section (I} of
section 87 and section 89" ghall be substituted;

(¢) sub-section (I10) shall be omitted;

(d) in sub-section (12), for the word and figures “and 89", {he
words, brackets, letter and figures “clause (d) of sub-section (I) of
section 87 and seetion 89” shall be substituted;

(e) sub-séction (13) shall be omitted.

28, In. section 89 of the principal Act, for sub-section (2), the followmg
sub-section . shall be substituted, na mely —_

Amend.-
meng of

section 175,

Amend-
ment of
section 80,

Amend.
ment of
section 81,

Amend-
ment of
section 88,

- Amengl-

meant of

. section 89,

“(2) The State Government shall constitute such number of
Transport Appellate Tribunals as it thinks fit and each such Tribunal
shall consist of a judicial officer who ig not below the rank of a District
Judge or who is qualified to be a Judge of the High Court and it
shall exercise jurisdiction within such area as may be notified by that
Government.” ‘

29. In section 91 of the principal Act, for sub-section (1), the follow-
ing sub-sectifi “§hail be substituted, namely‘ —

“(1) The hours of work of any person engaged for operating a
- trangport vehicle shall he snch as vrowﬂe in the Motor Transpert
27681961, . - Workers Act, 1961.". ! S

Amend-
meat of
section
9l.




Amend-
ment of
section 99.

Amend-
ment of
section
103,

Amend-
ment of
section
110.

Amend.
ment of
section
111,

Amend-

ment of

section
113,

Amend-

ment of

sections
114,

580

Motor Vehicles (Amendment)

{acT 54

30, Section 99 of the principal Actshall be re-numbered as sub-section
(1) thereof and after sub-section (I) as so re-numbered; the following
sub-section shall be inserted, namely: —

“(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub- section (1), when
‘a proposal is published under that sub-section, then from the date of
publication of such proposal, no permit shall be granted to any person,

except a

temporary permit during the pendency of the proposal

and

such temporary permit shall be valid only for a period of one year
from the date of its issue or till the date of final publication of the

scheme under section 10J, whichever is earlier.”,

31, In section 109 of the principal Act, after sub- secimn (2), the follow-

mg sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

“(3) If the Central Government is of the opinion that it is neces-
it may by order
published in the Official Gazette, notify that any article or process
used by a manufacturer shall conform to such qt'mdard as may be

sary or expedient so to do in the public interest,

specified in that mder ”

32. In section 110 of the principal Act,—

(¢) in sub-section (I),—

i

(1) for clause (b),.the followmg clause shall be substituted,
namely:—

“(by the size, nature, maximum retail price and condi-
tion of tyres, including embossing thereon of date and year of

manufacture, and

the maximum load carrying capacity;”;

(i) after clause (m), the iollowmg clauses shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(n) installation of catalytic convertors in the clags

vehicles to be prescribed;

e

oL

(0) the placement of audio-visual or radio or tape record-
er type of devices in public vehicles;

(py ‘warranty after sale of vehicle and norms therefor.”.

33. In section 111 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),—

4, Iﬁ section 113 of the principal‘Act in sub-section (I), for

(a) in clause (d), after the words “by prescribed authorities”, the
words “and fees to be charged for such test” shall be inserted;

(b) clause (g) shall be omitted.

the

words “heavy goods vehicles or heavy passenger motor vehicles”, the
words “transport vehicles” shall be subs’fltuted

35, Inn section 114 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the words
- beginning with “any person authorised” and ending with

“contravention of section 1137,

Vehicles

Department

authorised

the words

in

thig

“any officer of
‘behalf

the

the

by

words
Motor

the




or -1594] Motor Vehicles (Amendment) _ 581

State Government shiall, if he has reason to believe that a goods

vehicle or trailor is being used in contravention of sectmn 113" shall be
substituted.

36. In section 116 of the principal Act, in sub-section (7), for the words
“the -Schedule”, at both the places where they oceur, the words “the First
Schedule” ghall he substituted.

\
37. In section 127 of the principal Act—

(@) for subssection (1) the following sub-section shall be sub-
stituted, namely -

“(Iy Where any motor vehicle is abandoned or left unattenided
on a public place for ten hours or more or is parked in a place
where parking is legally prohibited, its removal by a towing ser-
vice or itg immobilisations by any means including wheel clamp-

ing may be authons'ed by a pohce officer in uniform having juris-
diction.”

(b) in sub-section (2), for the word “highway”, at both the placas
where it occurs, the words “public place” shall be substituted.

38. In section 129 of the principal Act, for the words “a protective
headgear of such descriptions as may be specified by the State Government
by rules made by itin this behalf, and different descriptions of headgears
may be-specified in such rules in relation to different circumstances or
different class or deseription of motor cycles”, the words “protective

headgear conforming fo the standards of B’areau of Indian Standards”
shall be substituted.

39. In section 130 of the principal Act,—

(4) for sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be substi-
tuted, namely:—

“(2y The conductor, if any, of a motor vehicle on any public
place shall on demand by any officer of the Motor Vehieles Depart-
ment authorised in_ this behalf, produce the licence for examina-
tion.";

(b) for sub-section (3), the following sub-section and Explanation
shall be substituted, namely:—

“(3) The owner of a motor vehicle (other than a vehicle re-
gistered under section 60), or in his absence the driver or other
person in charge of the vehicle, shall, on demand by a registering
authority or any other officer of the Motor Vehicles Department

duly authorised in this behalf, produce the certificate of insurance
of the vehicle and, where the vehicle is a transport vehicle, also
the certificate of fitness referred to in section 56 and the permit;
and if any or all of the certificates or the permit are not in his
possession, he shall, within fifteen days from the date of demand,
submit photo copies of the same, duly attested in person or send
the same by registered post to the officer who demanded it.

Explanationi~For the purposes of this sub-section; “certificate ~

of insurance” means the certificate issued under subasection (3)
of section 147.7,

Amend.
ment of
section
116,

Amend.
ment of
section
127.

Amend-
ment of
section
129,

Amend-
ment of
section
130,




Amend.-
ment of
szgtion
119

1A,

Amend-
ment of

sectiom
134,

Amend-
ment of
w:tmn
136.

Amend.
ment of
section

140,

382 Motor Vehicles (Amendment) [acT 54

46, In section 132 of the principal Act, in sub-section (/),—

) fO“‘ the words “may reasonably be necessary”, the words “may
for such T nable time ag may be necessary, bhdt not exceeding
ttvemy%oa homs shall be substituted; '

(by for clause (¢), the following clause shall be substituted,
namely: -

“{ay when required to do so by any police officer not below
the rank of a Sub-Inspector in uniform, in the event of the vehicle
being involved in the occurrence of an dg,mdent to a  person,
animal or vehicle ot of damage to property, or'’;

(c) clause (¢} shall be comitted.
41. In section 134 of the principai Act.—

(0) in clavse (a), for the words “and if necessary, convey him to
the nearest hospital”, the words “by conveying him to the nearest
medical practitioner or hospital, and it shall be the duty of every regis-
Leved medical pracfitioner or the doctor on duty in the hospital imme-

diately to attend to the injured person and render medical aid or treat-
ment without waiting for any pwo"emml formalities” shall he substitu-
ted;

(b) after clause (b), the following claus-'- and Explanation shall

be inserted, namely:—

— “(c) give the foliowing information in writing to the insurer,
who has issued the certificates of insurance, about the occurrence
of the accident, namely:-—

() insurance policy nugmber and period of its validity;
(1) date, time and place of accident;

(iit) particulars of the persons injured or killed in the
accident;

(iv) name of the driver and the particulars of his driving
licence.

Ixplanation.—For the purposes of this section, the expression
“driver* includes the owner of the vehicle.”.

f 42. In section 136, in the proviso, for the words *uthout unnecessary
delay”, the words “after comple‘rion of the formalities to the owner,
driver or the person in charge of the vehicle within twenty-four hours”
shall he substituted.

43. In section 140 of the principal Act,~

(¢) in sub-section (2),—

(1) for the words “twenty-five thousand rupees”, the Words
“fifty thousand rupees” shall be substituted;.




8 of {101,

o 1084] Motor Vehicles (Amendment)

(i) for the words “twelve thous and rupecs”, the words
“twenty-five thousand rupees” ghall be substituted;

(b) after sub.section (4), the following su»b‘~secti~on'and-proviso
shall be inserted, namely: —

“(5). Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (2}
vegarding death or bodily injury to any person, for which the
owner of the vehicle iz liable to give compensation for relief, he
is also liable to pay compensation under any other law for the
time heing in force:

Provided that the amount of such compensation to be  given
under any other law shall be reduced from the amount of compen-
gation payable under this section oy under section 163A.7

44, In section 141 of the principal Act, in sub-section (I), for the
words and bracket “eny other right (hereafter”, the words, figures, letter
and bracket “any other vight, except the right to claim under the scheme
referred to in section 163A (such other right hereafter” shall he substituted

45, In sectisn 146 of the principal Act, in sub-section (I}, before the
Explanation, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely: —
“Provided that in the case of a vehicle carrying, or meant

carry, dangerous or hazardous goods, there shall also be a policy
insurance under the Public Tiability Insurance Act, 1991.7.

44, In section 147 of the principal Act,

o
(b), in suh.clause (@), for the words “inj U“\, ta any person”, the words
“Injury to any person, including cowner of the- goods or hiz authoriced

representative carried in the vehicle” shall be substitutad,

in sub-section (1), in clav

47. In section 149 of the principal Act, in sub-section (I), after the
brackets and words “{being a lHability covered by the terms of the poliey)”
the words, figures and letter “or under the provisi

he provisions of section 185A7
shall be inserted.

48, In section 157 of the principal Act, after sub-section (I}, the follow-
ing Explanation shall he inserted, namely:—

that st f*h d@cmﬂé Lz‘aan':‘r shall mnmdc tra nsfer of zria s and lirhili-
ties of the said certificate of insurance and policy of insurance.”,

48, Tn section 158 of the orincipal “Act, for sub-section (6}, the follow-
ing sub-section shall be &ubsmute@ namely:—

“(8y Ag gron as any

at nformation regarding
ing death or

any aceident invole-
bodily ‘Y“tu“y to any person ig recorded or report vnder

olice officer, the officer inchavge of the
police station shall forward 2 copy of the same within thirty days fram

the date of recording of information or
pletion of such rer

this section 13 completed by

, as the case mav he, on com-
vt to the Claims Tribunal having iu,risd‘;c.tmﬂ and
a conv thereof to the conecerned insurer, and where a cony iz made
available to the owner, he shall also within thirtv davs of receipt of
such veport forward the same to such Claimg Tribunal and Tnsurer.”,

My

mer
sgetion
141.

Anmend-
meng of
section
146,

Amend
inent of
zection
147.

Amend-
ment of
section
143,

Amend-
men t Uf
saction

187.

Amend.
ment cf

tion

-



Amendl-
ment of
section
161.

Lnserlicg
of pew
sections
163A and
1698,

Special
provi-
51088

as to
payment
- of com-
pensation
on struc-
tured
formula
basis,

Option
1o fils
claim in
certain
cases,

Amend-
mentof
section
163,

Aaiends
ment of
section
166,

shall be substituted, namely:—

Motor Velicles (Amendment) [act B4

50, In section 161 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3),—

(a) in clause (a), for the words “gight thousand and five hundved
rupees”, the words “twenty-five thousand rupees” shall be substitu-
ted; .

(b) in clause (b), for the words “two thousand rupees”, ~ the

words “twelve thousand and five hundred rupees” shall be gubsgti-

tuted,

5L, After section 163 of the principal Act, the EOHOWuM sections shall

be inserted, mamely:—

‘163A, (I) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act or in
any other law for the time being in force or instrument having the force
of law, the owner of the motor vehicle of the authorised insurer
shal] be liable o pay in the case of death or permanent disableraent
due to accident arising out of the use of motor vehicle, compensation,
as indicated in the Second Schedule, to the legal hc1rs or tha vietim,

as the case may be. S,

Explanation.~For the purposes of this sub-section, “permanent
disability” shall have the same meaning and extent as in the Work-
men’s Compensation Act, 1923,

(2) In any claim for compensation under sub-section (I}, the
cisimant shall not be required to plead or establish that the death or
permanent disablement in respect of which the claim has been made
wag due to any wrongful act or neglect or default of the owner of
the wehicle or vehicles concerped or of any other person.

(3) The Central Government may, keeping in view the cost  of
living by notification in the Official Gazette from time to (ime amend

Lhe Second Schedule.

163B. Where a person i3 entitled to claim compensation under
section 140 and section 163A, he shall file the claim under sither of
the said sections and not under hoth.’

52. In section 165 of the principal  Act,—-

(a) in sub-section (7), in the Explanation, the words, figures and
letter “and section 163A” ghali be added at the end;

(b) in sub-section (3), in clause (c), the words “or as a Distric!
Judge” shall ke added at the end,

83. In section 166 of the principal Act—
(a) for sub-section (2)‘, the following sub-section and proviso

“® Hvery application under sub-section (1) shall he made.
at the option of the claimant, either to the Claims  "Tribunal

BSof 1923.

{
i
¢




Motor Vehicles (Ansend

mert)

585

- havirig*jurisdiction over the area in which thé - accident oc-

- ourped;

or'to the Claims Tribunal' within the local limits 6f whose

. jurisdiction’ thé -claimant - resides -or - carries - on business or - within
the local limits of whose jurisdiction the defendant resides, and
shall be in such form and contaln such partlculars ag may be

pr@scnbed
Provided that where no clann for compensawon under sec-

tion 140 is made in such application, the applicatioh shall contain
a separate gtatement to that effect immediately before the signa-
ture of the applicant.”;

(t) subssecticii '(3) shall be omitted;

(¢) for sub-section (4), the following sub;seéﬁén‘kshéﬁ be substi-

tuted, namely: .-
“(4). The Claimms Tribunal shall treat any report of accidents

forwarded to it under sub-section (6) of sec%wn 158 as an apph—
cation for compensatlon under this Act.”.

5‘4 After secmm 182 of the prmc1pal Act the fﬂllowmg sectmn shall

be 111‘1::»?1’1336 namely: -

“182A; Any pergon’ who contravenes the provisions of sub-séction
(3)" of section 109, shill be punishable with' a fine of one'thousand
rupees for the first offence, and with a fine of five théusand rupees
fm any subsequent oﬁemes ”

' clatée shall be’

4

“sect n,': 185 of the plmupal ‘Act, for clause (a), the followmg
substituted! namely:— ,
‘has, in his blood, alcohol exceedmg 30 1 mﬂ per 100 ml ~of
blaad detected in a test by a breath analyser, or”. R

06 For section 192° of thé principal” Act, the followmg sections shall
be substituted, namely:—

“192. (1) Whoever drives a motor vehicle: or -causes or allows a
motor vehicle to be used in contravention of the provisions of section
'89'shall be punishable for' the first offence with a fine which may
extend to five thousand rupees but shall not be less than.two. thousand

rupees for a second or subsequent offence wlth 1n1pr15‘0nment which ’

m.a‘y extend to one year Or Wlth ﬁne which may evlend to ten fhou-‘

. Provided' that -the Court may, for rea«;onq to be recorded, impose

a Iesser pumqhment

o

1peés but shall not be less than five thousand rupees or with

Ifisers
tion of -
new N
section,
1824,
Punish.
meng for
ofisnces
relating
to conse
fruction
and
mainfen
ance of

vehicleg,

Amend-
ment of
section
185..

Substi-
tution of
new -
sections
for 5
section
192,
Usinig
vehicle
without
negutta- ‘
tion,




586. Motor. ,Vehicles (Amendment) [acT 54

-(2)."Nothing in this section shall apply to thie use of a motor
vehlcle in. an_emergency for the conveyance of. pelsons suffering

- from sickness or injuries or for. the transport.of food or materialg i¢
relieve distress or of medical supplies for 2 like purpose: '

Provided that the person using the vehicle reports about the same
to the Regional 1ransport Authorlty With n seven days from the date
of such use. | ‘ v

P IR PO

' (3) The conrt to which an appeal lies from any conviction in
respect of an offence of the nature specified in sub-section (I), may
set aside or vary any order made by the court below, notwithstand'mg,

that no appeal lies against the conviction in connectmn W1th which

. such order was made, f )

Using 192A. (1) Whoever drives a motor vehicle or causes or allows a
vehicle ]

> . motor- vehicle to be used in coniravention of the provisions of sub-
without . . . " e |
permit. section (I} of section 66 or in contravention of any condition of a
permit relating to the route on which or the area in which or the

purpose for which the vehicle ‘mav be nsed, shzll be punishable for the ;

first offence with a fine which may extend to five thousand rupees

but shall not be less than two thousand rupees and for any subse-

quent offence with imprisonment which may extend to one year but j

- shall not be less than three months or with fine which may extend to ',ﬂ

‘ten thousand rupees but shall not- be legs than five thousand Tupeeas
or with both: ‘

Provided that the court may for reasous to be recorded, impose a
lesser punishment,

(2) Nothing in this section shall apply to the use of a motor
vehicle in an emergency for the conveyance of persong suifering o
.. Trom sickness or injury or for: the. transport.of materials, for. repat
or for the transport of food or materialg to relieve- dlstress or of .
medical supphes for a llke purpose:

Provided that the persnn using the vehicle reports about the same

-, to-the Regmnal Transport Autborlty within seven days from the date
of such use. , ; o ' ]

(3) The court to which an appeal lies from any conviction in
respect of an offence of the nature specified in sub-section (1), may seg
aside or vary any order made by the court below, notwithstanding

. : that no appeal lies agams} the conv1ct10n in connection with which
< such order was made PO ‘

i
T

g T\Amcn;_i_, 57. In section 194 of the principal "Act, for: euc -section - (1), the follow-=

mentof . Ing sub sectlon shall be substltufc'd mmcly "
“section :

194, “(1) Whoever drlves -4 motor vehx::le or causes or . allows a motor

. vehicle to be. driven in. contravention rof the. prov1510ns of .section . 113 !
or section 114 or section 115 shall be punishable with minimum fine
of two thousand rupees and an additionsl axnount of one thousand |

rupees per tonne of excess load, together with the hablhty to pay |
charges for' off-loading of the excess load.”., - , '



or 1894] ) Mo_tor: Vehicles (Amendment) 44
58. In section 200 of the principal Act, ‘in sub-éect‘i'_on (1), for the
word and figures “section 1899,”, the words, figures and brackets “section

88, sub-section (2) of section 190" shall be substituted,

59, In gection 201 of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-section (1), after the prov1so, the following proviso
shall be inserted, namely: —

“Provided further that where the vehicle is removed by a
Government agency, towing charges shall be recovered from the

vehicle owner or person in-charge of such vehicle.”;

(b) for sub-section (2), shall be

substituted, namely:—

the following sub-section

_ “(2) Penaltieg or towing charges under thig section shall be
recovered by such officer or-authority as the State Government
may, by notification in the Official Gazette, authorise.”.’

60, In section 202 of the principal Act, for sub-section (2), the

* follow-.
ing sub-section shall be substituted, namely:— V

“ (2)‘ A police officer in uniform may arfest without warrant any
person, who has committed an offence under this Act, if such - * person
refuses to .give his name and address.”.

61. In section 203 of the principal Act, for ~ the

sub-section (1),
following shall be substituted, namely:— o :

“(Iy A police officer in uniform or an officer of the Motor
Vehicles Department, as may be authorised in this behalf by that_
Department, may require any person driving or attempting to drive
a motor vehicle in a public place to provide one or more specimens

~ of breath for breath test there or nearby, if such police officer or officer
has any reasonable cause to suspect h1m of having committed an
offence under section 185:

Provided that requirement for hreath test shall be made '(unless _
- it is made) as soon as reasonably practicable after the commission -

" of such offence.”

62. In section 212 of the principal Act, in sub-section (4), after the
words, brackets and figures “sub-section (I) of section 112" the words,
brackets, figures and letter “sub-section (4) of section 163A” shall be
inserted, R

63. The Schedule to the principal Act shali be numbered as the
First Schedule thereof,

52 1 K

64 After ‘the Flirst Schedule, as so renumbered, the - following
Schedule shall be inserted, namely:—

i

Amend_
ment of
section
200.,

Amend-
ment of
section
201,

Amend.
ment of
section
202,

Amend-
ment of. -
section:
203.

Amend-
ment of
section
212,

Amend-
ment of
the
Schedule,

Insertion
of new

Schedule,



)

4

. Molor. Vel

588

fzif.EAC-?.'é 54

dicles (Amendment

WANE Geeq 29 pUY Jiestury SujupejuIvd SPIAg) pelngus
p_:ﬁ E;Qs Whom 9y [Ofga sestadxd o) JO UONBIRPISNOD Wl P B peonpal aq uasm wﬁﬁﬂo WUSPRSE [V§R) 5O eaauwﬂ E 18 v?g %] aouunnonES Jo Enoﬁa o4 taION

2 A .

% o o s s 15 o5 05 s o 05 05 s .t SRR .E__,_S 040Q¥
1220 4 WL 801 7L PRy TI9 #¢ v ow. 0% s os s . . . - 51569 .mku@ou.?n 5&8334
0 9 L. W 96 i 91w vy 875 05 oS o g : © | 53k Qg ‘Bpxa10u ng {4 55 940GV
o0y . 0% o 03T oz YL I 06 8 99 ¥ 05 05 Il C " S 55 ‘Bp¥2 100 11 "LIK 0§ 40V
08 Tr S 9w Y9l v 801 966 T6L & w05 05 : 536 0g “Bp¥ 100 1nq 516 S oAoqY
95 . $0S 955 Tz 91 9'6sI STWE UL T'60F b6 9'sL  &'se 05 s - 834 £ “Bp¥o 10U I0q 534 Op 940QY
00 % o€ o o031 I eI st L 66 18 € 05 91 "534 0 "8P¥8 10U ING 151K §§ SAYY
0% o5 veE  ssz TSI U6l TL I $'WE 9°0L w9y TLS 05 LI C “S1£ g “Bp¥> 101 10 62K 0F 9A0QY
85 T s S0c b0z 8't6F vEul ST 97l TUL &6 YL Is 8T 834 0 "3px9 10T I0q "8I §7 940QY
L 8w Ty we  9ir  TSoT 98T W vOW 8'SII CU6 9L ¥ LT "$14 57 “8p¥o 100 1nq "SI 0T 9404V
0%  v89 Sy e 8z 991 'Sl LI T8I PSr Tor  86L L8 9T 816 0 "5Px0 10U Iq I 5] 2A0QY
008 oz o 0% oz sz 0z 08T SSE  zel  ser kb 09 ST © - - sk ordn
O I B SR MO SR X SR T S G - I ‘ o

C B 5«6@ Jo: 33 q_ nos.mmnunﬁoo : -

mazﬁp@mh NI mmmHSm NEITELLINN WIIDIA 3G DV

000y OGOOE O000RT OCOST GOOZI OOYII QOZOF 0005 008 0099  OOKS 00Ty  00OE { swoouy [enuTy

R I T L T . . T . . L

\ - ) : SuapdIy wod v

SIIVEQ SE8VO wﬁ%ﬁ\ﬁzmnsg TVLVd A13V THHL 20 ROLLYSNIINOD mom Epgm

?ﬁ: Tonoes aa

FIAATHDS ANOOHS mE




589

-Motor Vehicles. (dmendment)

om; 40941

-/600°S Y
-/000°T
~/000°s

Jooo'ss

" -00s‘T

-/000°S
-/000°T

sy -
Sy~
sy —

S —

5 -

g -

‘5 —

pa0ge (D). W IpUx
pagroxds se. Eu&oﬁ&é 2103 Euﬁ&u& Jo esmo oe uy djqeded weq sAvyg Eso# au_aa uorjesuadmioo o a8eytaorad gons Eﬂnozaﬂv enaed juomewmasd .«waommu TE Y
. 10 “zopesuadwos oIy mSEEﬁ.oc Jo ajep

oy} do I3e o 0} srqeangdde wydnnp om E QWIOJUT JO SSO Jenuue 94} meuEnE 4g3e PoAISIE 0 [regs. oBﬁua JTNOWY 9y} JUDGELIp (8303 juagemarad 10 osed UL )

Fpteani] ped

—: 3UIA0][0F 94} JO WIS SYId

oM 0M-AYYg Supasoxe joU 10SMIO[GRSIP Jo powad [empor ._Sm ‘Aue J1 ‘OTIOSUI JOu SO s

! SUIPID0E [B1Ej-U0U JO N0 FUSLE WHILA oY) 0} AFfIqesip JO osed Ul sjqeAed oq J[eqs uopesusdwod SULMO[IOf YL

! SpuapLOOD NSQ uou U} biaeﬂQ

jusmAed omy) oUO sB meBuMB 10U 10g mbnuao&&za £q peysoddns poxmour sesuadxa Jenjoe —sosuadxyg ~8~EE Tc .

85..5 snoasus8-uoN (g)
mouE.E mzoguo 3
mmﬁbbum pue ured ()

I SAPNGUSKT pup saliful fo 3500 Ul SaSvwun(y iUz

/ma.%ouoxu ‘«Oﬂ b110] anu:ow\mzﬁ Aq peuoddns |eap &83 ponmour sasuadys [eryoe —sosuadxd [ROIPON (A1)
ayersg Jo sso7 (#0)

asnods o ST Are[oyauaq I ‘WnpIosuo) Jo ssoy (1)

sosuadxs Eo«,s 1 ()

‘3A0qe penIpIN0 suopestadwoo O doEvvm i oBa?n 84 [eys sedelie(] [eIUID w.EBo:& oL

K4

: (yoap fo asps W) aSvulvg pinidg .n

*000°0S S UelR $S9f 9q 30u jjeys vonesuadwod jo Hzoﬁ<.

-N.A .



fact 54 or 1664

Motor- Vehicles (Amendment)

50

L
| W
cspquonpddz se  af2we( [2I9USD),, AlUO ,no.ﬁn.wum Y0 JO 358D qH.
“osnods SuIAIAINS o \ . . o
Swares 04l JO owooul JO pIgfT SY— ‘ o ssnodg (9)

suosIad Surmres-uoN (&) -
erd 000°ST SY— . : ,

; _ : —: S)USpIOVE [elej-Uou Uy Ayjiqesip pue [ejed

- B I. JapIooR 01 JouId STHOSTY O PBY OYM 3S0T) 0} uonesusdwos I0] SWOIW] [2UCHEN ‘@

_ g6l 9oy uopesadwo) s; aoaio%
.sESH&nuﬁombnmmﬁﬁﬁ\,.:o&mowsﬁmiomb:oow ﬁé& PTe JUYIQesiCl [eRTE I YOI JUSTO[qESIC] [2I0L, JUITLIIST i SO Of PAUaop SO




